Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202223/249

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 06 October 2022

Subject: Number of medical devices, equipment and maintainance contracts

Q1 Approximately how many medical devices/EBME devices does the trust own?

A1 10,034
Please note the figure provided does not include devices purchased locally by
departments, the Trust does not routinely collate local procurement information centrally
as part of its management or performance data.

Q2 Approximately how many patient beds does the Trust have?

A2 152 open general & acute beds and 30 critical care beds.

Q3 Does the trust subcontract the maintenance of medical/lEBME devices to an outside
provider(s) or does it maintain the devices using internal engineers?
3a. If an external provider(s) is used, what is the name of the company(s)?
3b. If an external provider(s) is used, what was the value of the contract when
awarded?
3c. If an external provider(s) is used, what is the contract type — PPM/ Fully-
Comprehensive / Ad-hoc support?
3d. If an external provider(s) is used, what is the contract renewal date(s)?

A3 Both
a. See attached FOI 202223 249
b. See attached FOI 202223 249
c. See attached FOI 202223 249
d. See attached FOI 202223 249

Q4 Please provide the name, email address of the role responsible for managing medical
devices within the trust

A4 David Harrison, david.harrison2@lhch.nhs.uk

Q5 If medical device maintenance is managed internally, how many clinical engineers are
employed by the Trust?

A5 Eight

Q6 What is the current % of assets ‘within service date’ — ie, the date by which a device
must be serviced has not expired? (This will be a standard KPI)

A6 58%


mailto:david.harrison2@lhch.nhs.uk

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust



3a) Supplier name 3b) Annual Maintenance cost

SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £8,972.41
Konica Under warranty
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £8,972.41
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £8,972.41
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £8,972.41
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £8,972.41
MIUS £8,972.41
MEDRAY (UK) LTD £10,666.54
MEDRAY (UK) LTD £10,666.54
MEDRAY (UK) LTD £10,666.54
MEDRAY (UK) LTD £10,666.54
CARESTREAM HEALTH UK LTD £4,418
CARESTREAM HEALTH UK LTD £984
Hill-Rom (Med Eng) £203.68
Anetic Aid £315
MIUS £29,160.33
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £29,725.06
MED IMAGING LTD £350.00
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £6,729.31
WOLVERSON X-RAY £3,138
NHS SUPPLY CHAIN (LEEDS) £7,247.10
Siemens Under warranty
WOLVERSON X-RAY £2,854
Anetic Aid £315
Anetic Aid £315
NHS SUPPLY CHAIN (LEEDS) £7,247.10
ALTHEA UK AND IRELAND £52,000.00
MRI Devices Ltd £10,450.00
Bayer £1,905
WARDRAY PREMISE LTD £996
WARDRAY PREMISE LTD £996
WARDRAY PREMISE LTD £996
Siemens MES
WARDRAY PREMISE LTD £386
Bayer £3,964.00
Braun £1,436
Braun Under warranty
Braun Under warranty
WARDRAY PREMISE LTD £543
SUPPLY CHAIN COORDINATION £2,248.54
Canon £98,500.00
IRS £57,597.00
SECTRA LTD £400.00
SECTRA LTD £400.00
SECTRA LTD £400.00
SECTRA LTD £5,075.00
Wellbeing £70,797.00
Medray £15,829.85

Medray

Under warranty




Medray

Under warranty

Philips £52,897.65
Philips £37,694.31
NHS Supply Chain £38,828.00
Philips £33,182.05
Philips £37,694.31
NHS Supply Chain £39,527.73




3c) Contract Type 3d) Contract renewal date

COMPREHENSIVE 31.12.24
Information not held 31.03.23
COMPREHENSIVE 31.03.23
COMPREHENSIVE 31.03.23
COMPREHENSIVE 31.03.23
COMPREHENSIVE Information not held
COMPREHENSIVE 31.03.23
FULLY COMPREHENSIVE 1PM INCLUDED 31.03.23
FULLY COMPREHENSIVE 1PM INCLUDED 31.03.23
FULLY COMPREHENSIVE 1PM INCLUDED 31.03.23
FULLY COMPREHENSIVE 1PM INCLUDED 30.06.14
Information not held 30.06.14
Information not held 31.03.21
Information not held Information not held
PREVENT PLUS 31.03.23
COMPREHENSIVE 30.11.26
PRIMARY 31.03.23
MI SAFEGUARD Information not held
COMPREHENSIVE Information not held
Comprhensive 31.03.21
COMPREHENSIVE 11.26
MES 10/17/2022

Gold Comprehensive

Information not held

PREVENT PLUS

Information not held

PREVENT PLUS 31.03.21
COMPREHENSIVE 31.03.23
Gold 20.11.23
Information not held 28.08.23
Selectcare PM only Information not held
PLANNED PREVENTATIVE 31.03.19
PLANNED PREVENTATIVE 31.03.19
PLANNED PREVENTATIVE May-23
MES 11/30/2023
PLANNED PREVENTATIVE Oct-23
DIRECTCARE STANDARD Dec-20
Under Warranty Dec-20
Under Warranty Dec-20
Under Warranty 11/30/2023
PLANNED PREVENTATIVE Information not held
PLUS 2/23/2023
Under Warranty 31.03.23
Radiation protection 06.04.23
12 MONTH MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR IEP NODE 31.05.22
12 MONTH MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR IEP NODE 31.05.22
12 MONTH MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR IEP NODE 31.05.22
12 MONTH MAINTENANCE CONTRACT FOR IEP NODE TIER 2 07/01/2023
Information not held Apr-23
12 months fully comp 10/03/2023
Under Warranty- 12 months 10/05/2023




Under Warranty- 12 months

Information not held

Primary Information not held
Primary 10/20/2021

Primary Information not held
Primary Information not held
Primary Information not held

Primary

Information not held
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