

Reference FOI/2019/221

Number:

From: Other

Date: 31 May 2019

Subject: Prevent referrals last two financial years

- Q1 For each financial year (April 2017 March 2018 and April 2018 March 2019 or as close to these time frames as possible), please provide:
 - A. The number of Prevent referrals made by your Trust
 - B. The number of your Trust's Prevent referrals that have been discussed at the Channel Panel
 - C. The number of people that your Trust referred under Prevent who received Channel support

For A), B) and C) can you please provide where possible the numbers distributed by:

- 1. Whether the referral was made by a mental health service/department, or a nonmental health service/department
- 2. The ethnic groups of the referred people
- 3. The religious/faith groups of the referred people
- 4. The type of concern
- A1 A. 1. 4. Nil
 - B. 1. 4. Information not held not applicable as above
 - C. 1. 4. Information not held not applicable as above