Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI/2019/213
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 28 May 2019
Subject: International Recruitment
Q1 Please send me:
1. International recruitment budget
2. Current vacancies across: Doctors, Nursing & Midwifery and AHP & HSS
categories
3. Current supplier(s) for international recruitment projects/general permanent
recruitment
4. Any exclusive agreements or managed services used
5. Frameworks currently call off for International placements/general permanent
recruitment
6. The average fee for a Doctor, nurse, AHS/HSS that is placed with respective
rebate periods
Al 1. Information not held — we do not have a specific budget for international
recruitment
2. Doctors — 11.66 FTE vacancies
Nursing - 35.89 FTE vacancies
AHP - 11.51 FTE vacancies* (all posts appointed but pending start
dates)
HSS - 3.41 FTE vacancies*
*please note that there is cross over between the groups and figures may
include double counting of vacancies.
3. Information not held — not applicable — we do not have any contract or supplier
for these types of recruitment as all done in house
4. Information not held — not applicable see above
5. Information not held — not used
6. Information not held — not applicable see above



