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Q1 Please state the suppliers – and name of software used – for the following systems used 

by the trust:   
a. Electronic patient record  
b. Patient administration system  
c. Electronic prescribing and medicines administration  
d. Maternity information system  
e. Diagnostic imaging information system  
f. Electronic document management system  
g. Laboratory information management system  
h. Cyber security services   

  
A1 a. Altera – Sunrise Clinical Manager 

b. Alcidion – Integrated Care System 
c. Altera – Sunrise Clinical Manager 
d. Information not held – Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide maternity services 
e. Computerised Radiology Information Systems (CRIS) 2.10.15, Wellbeing 

Software 
Vue Picture Archiving and Communication Systems (PACS) 12.2.2, Philips 
Intellispace Cardiovascular (ISCV) PACS, Philips 

f. Hyland OnBase 
g. Information not held - laboratory services for the Trust are provided by Liverpool 

Clinical Laboratories.  
 
Liverpool Clinical Laboratories is a division of Liverpool University Hospitals NHS 
Foundation Trust. Please re-direct your request to: 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

h. Information exempt under s31 – law enforcement, specifically section 31 (1) (a) 
relating to the prevention and detection of crime. 
 
We have assessed the public interest in disclosure and believe the only factor for 
release would be openness and transparency, however the factors against 
release clearly outweigh this as release of the information would place the Trusts 
information systems and other related assets at risk of attack from hackers if 
released into the public domain. This would have a major impact on the Trusts 
ability to maintain confidentiality, integrity and availability of systems and 
information and would severely disrupt services to our patients and would have a 
substantial impact on the Trusts reputation therefore causing financial loss and 
would damage the Trusts commercial interests. 
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Q2 Please state the expiry date for the trust’s contracts with the suppliers referred to above 

for the systems in question.  
  
A2 a. May 2025 

b. March 2025 
c. May 2025 
d. Not applicable, as per A1d 
e. CRIS – June 2027 plus 5 years, Vue PACS – June 2023, ISCV PACS – June 

2029 
f. May 2025 
g. Not applicable, as per A1g 
h. Information exempt under S31, as per A1h 

 
  

 


