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Reference FOI1202223/188
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 19 August 2022
Subject: Use of Off-Framework Agency staff in theatres
Q1 Can you confirm names of all off framework agencies supplying into the trust directly for
nursing staff, specifically theatre staff.
With the above information, can this be broken down by
* Volume of supply (per month for the last 6 months)
* Total trust spend per agency (per month for the last 6 months)
A1 Information not held — The Trust does not use Off-Framework agencies
Q2 Please can you confirm how many nursing and theatre shifts have been
released/allocated to off framework agencies within the last 6 months
A2 Zero
Q3 Please can you confirm how many nursing and theatre shifts have been filled by off
framework agencies within the last 6 months
A3 Zero
Q4 For a 6 month period, can you confirm the average charge rate per hour for Band 5
Nursing agency staff across:
a. Week Days:
b. Night Shift/Saturday shifts:
c. Sunday shift/Bank Holiday:
A4 a. 35.08
b. 35.57
c. 4217
Q5 Can you confirm the highest agency nurse hourly charge rate, and their speciality?
A5 Catheter Lab - £40
Q6 For a 6 month period, can you confirm the average charge rate per hour Theatres Staff
agency staff across:
a. Week Days:
b. Night Shift/Saturday shifts:
c. Sunday shift/Bank Holiday:
broken down into, Scrub Nurse, ODP, Theatre nurse
A6 Information not held - January 22 — June 22 No Agency used in Theatres
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