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Contact details - Patient Service; Outpatient; CIO; Diagnostic & Imaging 

 
Q1 Under the freedom of information please could I request the following information 

The name and email address for the following job titles within your Trust 
1. Head of Patient Services 
2. Head of Outpatients 
3. Clinical Chief Information Officer 
4. Clinical Director for Children and Young People 
5. Clinical Director Acute Care 
6. Clinical Director Diagnostic and Imaging 

  
A1 1. We do not have this role, details for our Patient & Family Support Manager are 

available on our website: http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/our-patients/patient-family-
support/patient-and-family-support-team/  

2. We do not have this role, details for our Outpatients Manager are available on 
our website: http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/our-services/outpatient-services/  

3. Gregg Holland, Chief Information Officer, Gregg.Holland@lhch.nhs.uk  
4. Information not held – we do not have this role as a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre 
5. Information not held – we do not have this role as a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre 
6. We do not have this roles, details for our Clinical Lead for Radiology are 

available on our website: http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/gps-professionals/our-
divisional-teams/clinical-leads/  
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