Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202223/182
Number:
From: Commercial
Date: 17 August 2022
Subject: Usage and spend on International Recruitment
Q1 How many WTE vacancies do you have in the following staff groups?
a. Nursing
b. Radiographers
c. Doctors
d. Occupational Therapists
e. Physiotherapists
f. Podiatrists
g. Speech and Language Therapists
h. Midwives
A1 a. 22.71
b. 4.88
c. 17.67
d. 0.00
e. -2.49
f. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide podiatry services

1.10

. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide midwifery services
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Q2 Are you currently undertaking any international recruitment activity for any of the
following staff groups?

Nursing

Radiographers

Doctors

Occupational Therapists

Physiotherapists

Podiatrists

Speech and Language Therapists

Midwives
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A2 Yes

No

No

No

No

Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide podiatry services

No

. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide midwifery services
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Q3

A3

Q4

A4

Q5

How many international starters have you had in the following staff groups in the last 12

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital !L'ZIB

NHS Foundation Trust

months?
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Nursing

Radiographers

Doctors

Occupational Therapists
Physiotherapists

Podiatrists

Speech and Language Therapists
Midwives

82

4

2

0

0

Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide podiatry services

0

. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide midwifery services

How many international starters are you expecting in the following staff groups in the
next 12 months?
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Nursing

Radiographers

Doctors

Occupational Therapists
Physiotherapists

Podiatrists

Speech and Language Therapists
Midwives

18

0

0

0

0

Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide podiatry services

0

. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide midwifery services

Which, if any, suppliers are supporting with international recruitment for the following
staff groups?
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Nursing

Radiographers

Doctors

Occupational Therapists
Physiotherapists
Podiatrists



A5

Q6

A6
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g. Speech and Language Therapists

h. Midwives

a. NHS Professionals (NHSP)

b. None

c. None

d. None

e. None

f. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide podiatry services

g. None

h. Information not held — Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide midwifery services

What is the average cost per international placement (not including relocation
package/costs) for the following staff groups?

Nursing

Radiographers

Doctors

Occupational Therapists

Physiotherapists

Podiatrists

Speech and Language Therapists

Midwives
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a. The average cost of the recruitment of an international nurse is £11,093. This
based on an all inclusive fee that we pay to the recruiter
b-h. Not applicable



