Reference
Number:

From:

Date:

Subject:

Q1

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

FOI2021/155
Private Individual
05 May 2021

Annual spend for various suppliers from your last financial year April 2020 -
March 2021

Please could you provide the annual spend for the below suppliers from your last
financial year April 2020 - March 20217
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Alan Wilson Electrical Supplies

Albion Electric

AN Supplies Ltd

B E D ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTIONS

Bennett & Fountain

Bridge Electrical Supplies

C & K Supplies

CEL Electrical

City Electrical Factors

Contact Electrical Distributor

CRS Electrical Supplies Ltd

CUMBERLAND ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD
DINNING ELECTRICAL WHOLESALE

Edmundson Electrical

Electric Base

Electric Centre

ELECTRICAL WHOLESALE SUPPLIES LTD (EWS)
Electrical Wholesale Supplies Swansea Ltd
EXPERT ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES LTD

Eyre and Elliston Ltd

FYLDE ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES LTD

GCG ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LIMITED,
GILBEY ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD
GILTBROOK ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD
Hardings Electrical

IMPACT ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD
Independent Electrical Supplies

Juice Electrical Supplies

KEW ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD

LH Evans

LINCS ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD (LEW)
Links Electrical Supplies

MAINS ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD
Medlock

Newey & Eyre

NORTHERN & CENTRAL ORMSKIRK ELECTRICAL LTD
Park Electrical Distribution

Phase Electrical Distributors

QUALITY ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES AND TECHNOLOGY LTD
R & M Electrical



Al

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

0O0. Rexel

PP. Roblett Electrical Supplies Ltd

QQ. RS Components

RR. Ryness Electrical

SS. S & A Electrical Distribution

TT.  Screwfix

UU. Service Electrical Wholesale

VV. Smith Brothers

WW. Stearn Electrical

XX. SWIFT ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
YY. THE WHOLESALE LIGHTING & ELECTRICAL COMPANY
ZZ. TJELECTRICAL WHOLESALE LTD
AAA. TLC Electrical Supplies

BBB. TN Robinson

CCC. TRAFFORD ELEC WHOLESALERS
DDD. Upex Electrical Distributors Ltd

EEE. WF Senate

FFF. Wilson Electrical Distibutors Ltd
GGG. Wilts Wholesale

HHH. Wyeverne Electrical

1. YESSS Electrical

Please see attached document — FOI155-Supplier-Spends



Supplier

Alan Wilson Electrical Supplies

Albion Electric

AN Supplies Ltd

B E D ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTIONS

Bennett & Fountain

Bridge Electrical Supplies

C & K Supplies

CEL Electrical

City Electrical Factors

Contact Electrical Distributor

CRS Electrical Supplies Ltd

CUMBERLAND ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD

DINNING ELECTRICAL WHOLESALE

Edmundson Electrical

Electric Base

Electric Centre

Key: 0 = no amounts paid 20/21
Total amount from BlI, inc Tax
Information not held - this supplier is not on our system
Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system



AA.

BB.

CC.

DD.

EE.

FF.

GG.

HH.

ELECTRICAL WHOLESALE SUPPLIES LTD (EWS)
Electrical Wholesale Supplies Swansea Ltd
EXPERT ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES LTD

Eyre and Elliston Ltd

FYLDE ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES LTD

GCG ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LIMITED,
GILBEY ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD
GILTBROOK ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD
Hardings Electrical

IMPACT ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD
Independent Electrical Supplies

Juice Electrical Supplies

KEW ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD

LH Evans

LINCS ELECTRICAL WHOLESALERS LTD (LEW)
Links Electrical Supplies

MAINS ELECTRICAL DISTRIBUTORS LTD

Medlock

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system



1.

KK.

LL.

MM.

NN.

00.

PP.

Qa.

RR.

SS.

uu.

VV.

WW.

XX.

YY.

Z7.

Newey & Eyre

NORTHERN & CENTRAL ORMSKIRK ELECTRICAL LTD

Park Electrical Distribution

Phase Electrical Distributors

QUALITY ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES AND TECHNOLOGY LTD

R & M Electrical

Rexel

Roblett Electrical Supplies Ltd

RS Components

Ryness Electrical

S & A Electrical Distribution

Screwfix

Service Electrical Wholesale

Smith Brothers

Stearn Electrical

SWIFT ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

THE WHOLESALE LIGHTING & ELECTRICAL COMPANY

TJ ELECTRICAL WHOLESALE LTD

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

7032.86 - Rexel UKLTD

54.12

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system



AAA.

BBB.

CCC.

DDD.

EEE.

FFF.

GGG.

HHH.

TLC Electrical Supplies

TN Robinson

TRAFFORD ELEC WHOLESALERS

Upex Electrical Distributors Ltd

WEF Senate

Wilson Electrical Distibutors Ltd

Wilts Wholesale

Wyeverne Electrical

YESSS Electrical

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system

Information not held - this supplier is not on our system
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