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Q1 Does the organisation have any digital innovation programmes that aim to develop digital
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tools and solutions to transform and improve processes in the below areas listed in the
table? If yes, please provide details in the below table

Area Yes/No | Aim and Summary Is the programme in
of the programme | collaboration with other NHS
organisations or companies?
Talent Management No Information not held | Information not held
e.g., Succession
Planning, upskilling
staff
Initiatives outlined in No Information not held | Information not held
the People Plan e.g.,
health & wellbeing,
flexible working,
learning & development
Private Patient Care/ No Information not held | Information not held
Units
Staff Task No Information not held | Information not held
Management
Community Services No Information not held | Information not held
Discharge Processes No Information not held | Information not held
Other No Information not held | Information not held

Does the organisation have a charity that supports or provides funding for digital
innovation at the organisation? E.g., Imperial College Healthcare NHS Trust has the
charity Innovate at Imperial

No

Who is the lead for digital innovation at the organisation? Please provide their name and
job title

Kate Warriner, Chief Digital and Information Officer
Who is the lead for strategy at the organisation? Please provide their name and job title
This role falls under our Director of Strategy & Partnerships — Jonathan Develing

Who is the lead for strategic performance at the organisation? Please provide their name
and job title

This role falls under our Chief Operating Officer — Hayley Kendall
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Who is the lead for transformation at the organisation? Please provide their name and
job title

Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 -
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure Log,
please see FOI Request Ref: 046:
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-Ihch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/

Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. Select
Download to open.

Who is the Chief Information/Technology Officer at the organisation? Please provide
their name and job title

This role falls under our Chief Digital and Information Officer - Kate Warriner
Does the organisation have a team/department that handles digital innovation?
a. If yes, please name these teams/departments and the members names and job

titles.

Yes
a. Digital innovation is handled by the digital team

Does the team/department develop front facing service user websites/apps?
a. If yes, please state the websites/apps developed and their use.

Yes
A. Cystic Fibrosis - Online Psychological Annual Review Form
The annual screen assesses patients’ psychological well-being over the past year
and helps to identify patients who may have been struggling who haven’t been picked
up by the MDT and to proactively identify patients who may need support in the near
future.
Have the team/department ever applied for external tenders for healthcare
developments?
a. If yes, please state which external tenders.
No
Have the teams/departments ever done developments for other organisations/external
entities?
a. If yes, please provide details on the developments
No

Have the teams/departments ever sold a development it has produced commercially?
a. If yes, please provide details of the development sold


http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
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Al2 No

Q13 Have the teams/departments ever attempted to secure an innovation grant?
a. If yes, please state which innovation grant and if they were successful

Al3 Yes
a. i3i, unsuccessful



