
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI/2020/151 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

26 May 2020 

Subject: 
 

Contracts Register 

 
 
Q1 I want to submit a request for some information from the organisation, in relation to their 

contract’s register. 
The contract register should display all the organisations existing/live contracts I would 
like the register to display the following columns/headings: 
  

a. Contract Reference 
b. Contract Title 
c. Procurement Category 
d. Supplier Name 
e. Spend (Total or Annual) 
f. Contract Duration 
g. Contract Extensions 
h. Contract Starting Date 
i. Expiration Date 
j. Contract Description [Please provide me with as much detail as possible.] 
k. Contact Owner (Full contact details if possible.) 
l. CPV codes/ProClass 

  
A1 a. See attached – FOI2020151 

b. See attached – FOI2020151 
c. Information not held - the Trust does not routinely hold this information. 
d. See attached – FOI2020151 
e. See attached – FOI2020151 
f. See attached – FOI2020151 
g. See attached – FOI2020151 
h. See attached – FOI2020151 
i. See attached – FOI2020151 
j. See attached – FOI2020151 
k. See attached – FOI2020151 
l. Information not held - the Trust does not routinely hold this information. 

  
Q2 Can you also provide me with contact details of the person responsible for the actual 

contract’s register or someone responsible for API? [Name, Job Title, Telephone, Email 
Address] At the very least provide me with their actual job title. 

  
A2 Steven Doran, Head of Procurement, 0151 600 1638, steven.doran@lhch.nhs.uk 
  
 

mailto:steven.doran@lhch.nhs.uk


Liverpool Heart and 
Chest Hospital NHS 
Foundation Trust - 
Contracts Register

Contract Name 
Contracts to be logged in 
alphabetical order Contract Ref Supplier (s)

Description (Services 
or Products) Start Date

End Date          
(Exc. Extn)

Extension 
Options 
(Months)

 Contract Value inc. 
VAT 
(inc. Extenstion 
Option) 

Lead Trust/Hub 
(if a framework) Lead Manager

Contact 
Number 

Notice 
Period

3M Medicode n/a 3M United Kingdom plc Clinical Coding system 12-Dec-19 11-Dec-20 £5,306.27 Not Applicable Clinical Coding 
Manager Ext. 1441

Angiography Procedure Packs 2011 9-013494 Smiths Medex Medical Consumables 01-Nov-16 31-Oct-20 0 months £448,000.00 Not Applicable

Contracts 
Manager

Ext. 1309 3 months

Blue Cherry Spirostik n/a Love Medical Clinical Software 
Support 24-Aug-19 23-Aug-20

One year 
option to 
renew

£12,225 + VAT Not Applicable
Manager 
Pulmonary 
Function

Ext. 1782

Catering Services T/0162 Medirest Catering services 01-Oct-18 30-Sep-23 24 months £6,720,000 Not Applicable Facilities 
Manager Ext. 1695 6 months

Cath Lab Consumables 09/S 136-
198978/EN Consumables 01-Nov-16 31-Oct-20 0 months £6,000,000.00 Not Applicable Contracts 

Manager Ext. 1309 3 months

Cath Lab Scheduling Software n/a CareCube Clinical Software 11-Dec-17 10-Dec-20 until 
10-Dec-22 £0.00 Divisional Head 

of Operations Ext. 1614

Childcare Vouchers n/a EdenRed Childcare vouchers 01-Aug-19 31-Jul-22 12 months £100,000 
Crown 
Commercial 
Services

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1661 6 months

Clinical Utilisation Review 
(MCAP System, Implementation, 
and Support)

NHSE Framework Oak Group Clinical Software 30-Oct-16 29-Oct-19 36 months £223,500.00 NHSE

Chief Operating 
Officer

Ext. 1791 6 months

Clinical Waste Services
HTE project ref: 
17780, ITT ref: 
29522

SRCL Limited Clinical waste services 15-Apr-18 14-Apr-21 24 months £600,000 Health Trust 
Europe Facilities 

Manager
Ext. 1695 6 months

Community Electronic Patient 
Record Support Services

NHS SBS 
Framework 
Agreement for the 
Provision of 
Healthcare Clinical 
Information 
Services

EMIS Electronic patient record 21-Dec-17 21-Dec-22 24 months £574,692 NHS SBS
Project 
Manager – 
Digital Systems

Ext. 3029 6 months



Confidential Waste Destruction 
Services

Confidential 
Waste Destruction 
Services

Shred-It Confidential Waste 
Destruction Services 10-Aug-19 09-Aug-22

Facilities 
Manager

Ext. 1695

COSHH Management
COSHH 
Management 
Services

Alcumus Sypol Limited 01-Jul-19 30-Jun-23 0 months £24,000.00 Risk and Safety 
Lead Ext. 1051

Decontamination Services Aintree 
Framework Steris Decontamination 

Services 01-Jun-19 30-Nov-21 24 months £550,000 Not Applicable Chief Operating 
Officer Ext. 1791 6 months

EAP Services n/a Mersey Care Staff Support 
(Wellbeing) Services 31-Aug-20 Head of HR

Electronic Patient Record 
Support Services

NHS SBS 
Framework 
Agreement for the 
Provision of 
Healthcare Clinical 
Information 
Services

Allscripts Healthcare IT 
UK Limited Electronic patient record 22-Jun-17 21-Jun-22 36 months £1,917,665 NHS SBS Head of IT Ext. 1509 6 months

EMIS Tquest NHS SBS 
LD21392 EMIS

Healthcare clinical 
information system 
services

17-Jul-19 16-Jul-20 12 months £97,440 NHS SBS
Project 
Manager – 
Digital Systems

Ext. 3029

E-rostering Allocate Cloud 
Services

P.O.124119221 
(Year 1 of 5)) Allocate Rostering Software and 

Services 01-Oct-15 30-Sep-20 12 months £177,098 Not Applicable

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1848

E-rostering Allocate E-Services 
(SaaS)

P.O.124119474 
(one-off 
implementation); 
P.O.124119054 

Allocate Rostering Software and 
Services 01-Oct-15 30-Sep-20 12 months £65,148 Not Applicable

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1848

E-rostering Allocate 
HealthMedics n/a Softcat/Allocate Rostering Software and 

Services 30-Nov-16 29-Nov-21 0 months £227,456 Health Trust 
Europe

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 

Ext. 1848

E-Rostering Support Services T/0166 SCC/Allocate/Sprint ii 
Framework

Rostering Software and 
Services 09-Sep-15

Additional 
Perpetual HR 
Software 
Licence

£18,000 Not Applicable

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1848 6 months

E-Tendering System n/a Proactis E-tendering software 
and support services 01-Sep-18 31-Aug-22 None £25,344.00 CCS Head of 

Procurement Ext. 1638 12 
months

Expenses Health Services LHC001 Software Europe ... now 
Selenity Limited

Expenses Health 
Services 01-Oct-14 30-Sep-17 0 months £14,000 Not Applicable

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1848 6 months



External Audit Services T/0192 Grant Thornton External Audit Services 09-Sep-17 30-Sep-20 24 months £339,600 Not Applicable Chief Finance 
Officer Ext. 1062 6 months

Finance/Procurement System 2016/S 080-
141312 SBS Shared Services

Finance/Procurement 
System software and 
support services

01-Apr-12 31-Mar-20  0 months £1,250,000 NHS SBS Deputy Chief 
Finance Officer 6 months

G2 Speech Digital Dictation; 
Support and Maintenance 
Services; Outsourced 
Transcription

n/a G2 Speech Software and Support 
Services 01-Jun-17 31/06/2020 0 months £75,000.00 Not Applicable Head of IG and 

Administration Ext. 1368 6 months

Haemofiltration Equipment and 
Consumables T/0204 Fresenius Medical Care

Haemofiltration 
Equipment Service 
Support and 
Consumables

01-Nov-14 30-Oct-19 0 months £770,000 Not Applicable Critical Care 
Manager

Ext. 1062 6 months

Healthy Imaging MIT2020-1047 Philips Healthcare
Phase 1 pilot - 
Cardiology Archiving 
system (ISCV)

01-Apr-20 31-Mar-23 0 months 216,054.28 LHCH PACS/RIS 
Manager

n/a

ICS Clinical Information System 
(PAS) T/0217 Silverlink Software

Patient Administration 
System and Support 
Services

01-Oct-15 31-Mar-21 36 months £2,252,741 Not Applicable Head of IT Ext. 1509 6 months

Interpreter and Translation  
Services n/a Beacon Languages Interpreter and 

Translation  Services 01-Apr-19 31-Mar-20 12 months £64,800.00 
Patient & 
Family Support 
Manager

Interpreter and Translation  
Services n/a Language Line Limited Interpreter and 

Translation  Services 05-Mar-19 05-Mar-20 12 months
Patient & 
Family Support 
Manager

Inventory Management System n/a Omnicell UK Ltd 
(previously Avantec)

Inventory Management 
System and Software 
Support Services

01-Apr-10 31-Mar-20 12 months Not Applicable Head of 
Procurement Ext. 1638

IMT n/a Informatics Merseyside 
(IM) IM&T Support Services 01-Apr-20 31-Mar-21 24 months £788,173 p.a n/a Head of Digital 

Systems Ext. 3014

Laundry Services
HTE 
Ref:SF026718-
041 

Berendsen Laundry services 01-May-15 30-Apr-20 24 months £1,500,000 Health Trust 
Europe Facilities 

Manager
Ext. 1695 6 months

Lift service and maintenance n/a Allied Lift Services Ltd Lift service and 
maintenance 01-Apr-19 31-Mar-20 12 month 

rolling £49,048,46 Head of Estates

Mobile Voice and Data Services T/0201 EE Limited Mobile Voice and Data 
Services 22-Jan-14 21-Jan-18 12 months £50,000 CCS Framework - 

RM1498 Lot 6 Head of IT Ext. 1509 3 months

Modular Building Hire T/0183 Portakabin Modular Building Hire 01-Apr-14 31-Mar-19 0 months £665,128.00 CCS Framework - 
RM875/4

Chief Operating 
Officer Ext. 1899 n/a

Monitoring Services
ICD Device 
Monitoring 
(Latitude)

Boston Scientific Clinical Monitoring 
Services 01-Apr-20 31-Mar-21 12 months n/a Senior Chief 

Cardiac Clinical 
Physiologist

Monitoring Services
ICD Device 
Monitoring (Care 
Link)

Medtronic Clinical Monitoring 
Services 01-Apr-20 31-Mar-21 n/a Senior Chief 

Cardiac Clinical 
Physiologist

Multi-Function Devices T/0200 Konica Minolta Print services 30-Jun-18 29-Jun-23 0 months £179,745.20 CCS Framework - 
RM1599 Head of IT Ext. 1509 3 months

Natural Gas RM897 Corona Energy Supply of Natural Gas 01-Apr-12 31-Mar-18 12 months CCS Framework - 
RM897

Chief Operating 
Officer Ext. 1899 6 months



Network Infrastructure Support CCS RM1054 ANS Network Infrastructure 
Support Services 11-Oct-16 11-Oct-19 0 months CCS Head of Digital 

Systems Ext. 3022 6 months

NHS Membership Database 
System n/a 

Membership 
Engagement Services 
Limited

Database Services 29-Jun-17 28-Jun-20 0 months £20,000 Not Applicable
Director of 
Corporate 
Affairs

Ext. 1688 6 months

Occupational Health Services n/a Team Prevent Occupational Health 
service 01-Sep-16 31-Aug-19 24 months £679,000 Not Applicable Head of HR Ext. 1848 6 months

Off site Data Centre - Clinical 
and Digital Information Systems 
Framework (CDIS)

LPP Aimes

Off site Data Centre - 
Clinical and Digital 
Information Systems 
Services

01-May-18 31-Mar-23 12 months £300,000.00 LPP Head of IT Ext. 1509 6 months

Off site Medical Records 
Storage

NHS SBS 
15/CW/ZWD/8846
/08

Restore Offsite document 
storage and destruction 27-Feb-20 26-Feb-24 n/a

Information Not Held 
– Transactional 
Costs

NHS SBS Head of IG and 
Administration Ext. 1368 6 months

PACS 352564-2011-EN Carestream
Picture Archiving and 
Communication System 
Services

01-Jul-18 30-Jun-23 0 months £562,812 RLBUHT/A.Gask
ell

PACS/RIS 
Manager Ext. 1705 6 months

Payroll Services HTE St. Helen's & Knowsley 
NHS Trust Payroll Services 01-Oct-17 30-Sep-19 36 months £170,000 Health Trust 

Europe

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext. 1848 6 months

Pharmacy Secure Courier 
Service n/a Cal Sameday Limited Courier services 02-Jun-19 02-Jun-21 36 months

Information Not Held 
– Transactional 
Costs

n/a Deputy Chief 
Pharmacist Ext. 1470 4-weeks

Pharmacy Secure Courier 
Service n/a ERS Courier services 02-Aug-19 01-Aug-21 36 months £27,679.05 n/a Deputy Chief 

Pharmacist Ext. 1470 4-weeks

Pharmacy Secure Courier 
Service n/a Merlin Courier services 02-Jul-19 01-Jul-22 24 months

Information Not Held 
– Transactional 
Costs

n/a Deputy Chief 
Pharmacist Ext. 1470 4-weeks

Pharmacy System Software and 
Support T/0207 Ascribe Limited (Now 

Emis) Clinical software 01-Apr-15 31-Mar-20 24 months £170,000 Not Applicable Chief 
Pharmacist Ext. 1378 6 months

Qlikview n/a ClikHealth Solutions Finance Software 
Services 01-Jul-20 30-Jun-21 12 months £12,129.00 Income 

Accountant 

Radiation Protection Services n/a IRS Limited Radiation Protection 
Services 01-Apr-17 31-Mar-19 12 months £75,000.00 Not Applicable PACS/RIS 

Manager Ext. 1705 6 months

Radiology Information Services 
(CRIS) 352564-2011-EN HSS (now Wellbeing 

Software Group Ltd)

Patient Administration 
System and Support 
Services

01-Jul-18 30-Jun-23 0 months £421,200 RLBUHT/A.Gask
ell

PACS/RIS 
Manager Ext. 1705 6 months

Replacement Cardiology 
Archiving system 
(Xcelera/Intellispace)

NHS URN: MDC 
1099 P&R 14 Philips Healthcare Cardiology Archiving 

system (Xcelera) 01-Nov-14 31-Mar-19 0 months £53,000 PACS/RIS 
Manager Ext. 1705 6 months

Risk Management Software and 
Support Ref: 000009 Datix Ltd Risk management 

system and support 01-Aug-15 31-Jul-20 60 months £108,000 Not Applicable Risk and Safety 
Lead Ext. 1051 6 months

Siemens CT Scanner -Somatom 
Definition Flash NHS SC 203 Siemens 01-Feb-12 01-Feb-19 0 months £896,000.00 NHS SC 

Framework - 203

Service Line 
Manager for 
Radiology

Ext. 1221 n/a



Text Messaging Services n/a EE Limited Text Messaging 
Services 17-Dec-15 16-Dec-19 12 months £11,100 CCS RM1498

HealthRoster & 
Temporary 
Staffing 
Manager

Ext. 1492

TRAC Recruitment System n/a TRAC TRAC Recruitment 
System 04-Oct-19 03-Apr-20 £11,040 p.a. CCS G Cloud 11 

Framework

Resourcing and 
Workforce 
Systems 
Manager

Ext.1848

Travel Management Services CCS Framework Redfern Travel Travel services 01-Apr-13 31-Mar-18 12 months CCS Head of 
Procurement Ext. 1638 6 months

Maintenance Contracts - various n/a Various 
Servicing and 
Maintenance of Medical 
Equipment

Various Various Various £534,558.65 Head of 
Procurement Ext. 1638
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