

Reference FOI/2020/145

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 21 May 2020

Subject: Theatre and Critical Care equipment for Patients having General Anaesthetics

- We are looking to establish the average number of tests performed each week within the following Theatres & Critical Care:
 - a. Percentage of general anaesthetic patients that use a laryngeal mask in general theatres
 - b. Percentage of general anaesthetic patients that use a laryngeal mask in day theatre
 - c. Percentage of general anaesthetic patients that use an ET tube in general theatres
 - d. Percentage of general anaesthetic patients that use an ET tube in day theatres
 - e. Number of general anaesthetics per week
 - f. Annual single lung ventilation
 - g. Annual BAL/BW (Bronchial lavage & Bronchial wash)
- A1 a. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
 - b. Information not held as per a.
 - c. Information not held as per a.
 - d. Information not held as per a.
 - e. Information not held as per a.
 - f. Between 11 17 each week
 - g. Information not held as per a.