

Reference FOI202223/130

Number:

From:

Private Individual

Date: 08 July 2022

Subject: Recruitment of infrastructure support roles across non clinical departments

and agencies used

- Q1 Please may you provide me with the following data, segmented into the categories listed in the table below:
 - a. The number of infrastructure support (non-clinical) contract/interim roles you recruited via an agency (agency defined as recruitment or executive search firm) in FY 2020/21 (12m to March 2021) and FY 2019/20 (12m to March 2020)
 - b. The number of infrastructure support (non-clinical) contract/interim roles in FY 2020/21 (12m to March 2021) and FY 2019/20 (12m to March 2020) that were above Band 7
 - c. The average contract length for infrastructure support (non-clinical) contractors/interims
 - d. The average Day Rate Charge for infrastructure support (non-clinical) contractors/interims Band 7 and above
 - e. The number of infrastructure support (non-clinical) permanent/substantive roles you recruited via an agency (agency defined as recruitment or executive search firm) in FY 2020/21 (12m to March 2021) and FY 2019/20 (12m to March 2020)
 - f. The number of infrastructure support (non-clinical) permanent/substantive roles in FY 2020/21 (12m to March 2021) and FY 2019/20 (12m to March 2020) that were above Band 7
- A1 a. Zero
 - b. Zero
 - c. Information not held not applicable as per A1a
 - d. Information not held not applicable as per A1a
 - e. Zero
 - f. Zero