

Reference FOI2021/129

Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 21 April 2021

Subject: Patients detained under MHA - eating disorder on general/paediatric ward

- Q1 Please state the name of your Hospital Trust
- A1 The Liverpool Heart and Chest NHS Foundation Trust
- Q2 How many patients on the paediatric ward were detained under the Mental Health Act with an eating disorder diagnosis in the following financial years;
 - a. 2017/2018
 - b. 2018/2019
 - c. 2019/2020
 - d. 2020/2021
- A2 Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide paediatric services.
- Q3 How many adult patients were detained on a general ward under the Mental Health Act with an eating disorder diagnosis in the following financial years;
 - a. 2017/2018
 - b. 2018/2019
 - c. 2019/2020
 - d. 2020/2021
- A3 A-C: Information not held the Trust did not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.

 D: Zero