
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/128 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

08 July 2022 

Subject: 
 

Medical Equipment suppliers and renewal dates 

 
 
Q1 Defibrillators- 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A1 a. Stryker 

b. 2017-2019 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q2 Mobile x-ray devices- 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A2 a. Medray 

b. 2014 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q3 Infusion pumps - 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A3 a. Arcomed and Baxter 

b. 2021 and various Baxter devices 2011 to 2016 
c. Information not held – Arcomed devices not pre-determined. Baxter devices due 

for replacement in 2023 
  
Q4 Temperature devices Electric handheld-  

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A4 a. Cardinal Health 

b. 2019-2022 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q5 Temperature devices Tethered to vital signs monitor-  

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  



 
A5 Information not held – No such devices in the Trust 
  
Q6 High Acuity Monitoring devices – THEATRES 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A6 a. Draeger 

b. 2019-2021 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q7 High Acuity Monitoring devices - ICU 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A7 a. Draeger 

b. 2019-2021 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q8 Vital Signs (ward based monitors)- 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A8 a. Mindray 

b. 2015-2017 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q9 Anaesthetic machines- 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A9 a. Draeger 

b. 2005-2017 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

  
Q10 Ventilators- 

a. Current Supplier Name 
b. Installation date 
c. Replacement date 

  
A10 a. Draeger 

b. 2013-2016 
c. Information not held – this has not been pre-determined 

 


