
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202324/112 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

06 June 2023 

Subject: 
 

Contact details for the Divisional Directors and General Managers 

 
Q1 Please can you detail the name, telephone number and email address of the below 

people the Health Board? 
 

a. Divisional Director – Surgical 
 

b. Divisional Director – Medical 
 

c. Divisional Director – Elective care 
 

d. General Managers – Surgery 
 

e. General Managers – Medicine 
 

f. General Managers – Elective care 
  
A1 a. Lucy Currie, Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk 

 
b. Ellis Hayes, Ellis.Hayes@lhch.nhs.uk 

 
c. Information not held - we don’t have a separate director for Elective Care. This 

would fall under the responsibility of the named lead who is Lucy Currie, 
Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk 

 
d. Lisa Edwards, Lisa.Edwards@lhch.nhs.uk 

 
e. Liz Taylor Liz.Taylor@LHCH.nhs.uk and Georgia Von Bargen, 

Georgia.VonBargen@LHCH.nhs.uk 
 

f. Information not held - we don’t have a separate manager for Elective Care. This 
would fall under the responsibility of the named lead who is Lucy Currie, 
Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk 
 

Regarding telephone numbers: Information not held – Many staff in this area now adopt 
an agile approach to working meaning they do not have a set workspace with direct 
telephone contact. Staff use email as their main method of correspondence or may be 
contacted via the hospital switchboard. 

 

mailto:Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk
mailto:Ellis.Hayes@lhch.nhs.uk
mailto:Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk
mailto:Lisa.Edwards@lhch.nhs.uk
mailto:Liz.Taylor@LHCH.nhs.uk
mailto:Georgia.VonBargen@LHCH.nhs.uk
mailto:Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk

