Reference FOI202324/109

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 05 June 2023

Subject: Supplier names for system used in different departments

- Q1 Please can you provide the Supplier Name / System Name for the solution used for the following areas please:
 - a. EPR
 - b. Maternity
 - c. Vital Obs
 - d. A&E
 - e. Inpatients
 - f. Theatres
 - g. Outpatients
- A1 a. Allscripts (Altera) & Silverlink ICS
 - b. Information is not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and therefore does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services.
 - c. Mindray
 - d. Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not have an Accident and Emergency department (A&E)
 - e. Allscripts (Altera) & Silverlink ICS
 - f. Allscripts (Altera) & Silverlink ICS
 - g. Allscripts (Altera) & Silverlink ICS