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Number:  

FOI/2020/084 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

02 March 2020 

Subject: 
 

Organisational Structure Chart 

 
Q1 Please provide me with an up to date Organisational Structure chart showing Team 

Managers and Service Managers and their email addresses for General Nursing, Primary 
Care, Mental Health, Learning Disabilities and Psychological Therapies across your trust. 

  
A1 General Nursing - Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 

2000 - ‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website: Nursing Team - http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/gps-
professionals/our-nursing-team/   
 
Primary Care - Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist 
adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide primary care services 
 
Mental Health - Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist 
adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide mental health services 
 
Learning Disabilities - Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a 
specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Learning Disabilities services  
 
Psychological Therapies – see attached document Psychology Mar-20_Redacted 

 

http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/gps-professionals/our-nursing-team/
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/gps-professionals/our-nursing-team/


LHCH DEPARTMENT OF CLINICAL HEALTH PSYCHOLOGY 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

LEAD CONSULTANT CLINICAL PSYCHOLOGIST/ HEAD OF PSYCHOLOGY Services (8D) 1.0 wte 

 (incl.  Clinical lead; operational; managerial; professional & strategic lead responsibilities) 

Mark Griffiths 

Snr Clinical 

Psychologist (8A)   

1.0 CF (  

Lead: CF 

 

Snr Clinical 

Psychologist (8A)  

1.0wte  

Lead: Cardiology  

 

 

KCRS Counsellor 

(6) 

1.0 wte ( ) 

Snr Clinical 

Psychologist (8A)  

0.6 wte (  

Lead: Community 

Respiratory  (KCRS) 

 

 

Snr Clinical 

Psychologist (8A)  

0.8 wte (VACANCY) 

Lead: ACHD  
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