Reference FOI202324//079

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 18 May 2023

Subject: Contact details for the Trust's Chief People Officer, Head of recruitment and

International recruitment lead

Q1 The name and best contact details for your Chief People Officer

Please provide the following where available.

- a. Contact name
- b. Email address
- c. Best contact number
- A1 a. Karen Nightingall
 - b. Karen.Nightingall@lhch.nhs.uk
 - c. 0151 600 1339
- Q2 The name and best contact details for your Head of recruitment

Please provide the following where available.

- a. Contact name
- b. Email address
- c. Best contact number
- A2 a. Peter Cook, Recruitment and Resourcing Lead
 - b. Peter.Cook@Ihch.nhs.uk
 - c. Information not held Many staff now adopt an agile approach to working meaning they do not have a set workspace with direct telephone contact. Staff use email as their main method of correspondence or may be contacted via the hospital switchboard.
- Q3 The name and best contact details for your International recruitment lead or whoever would be the primary contact responsible for the recruitment of Non-Clinical: Admin & Clerical, Corporate Functions, and Estates, FM and Ancillary staff.

Please provide the following where available.

- a. Contact name
- b. Email address
- c. Best contact number
- A3 Information not held Each department is responsible