

Reference FOI/2020/074

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 21 February 2020

Subject: International recruitment

Q1 Please send me:

- 1. International recruitment budget (If not an allocated budget, under which cost centre would the budget sit?)
- 2. Current vacancies across: Doctors, Nursing & Midwifery and AHP (Allied Health Professionals, e.g. Radiographers) & HSS (Health Science Services, e.g. Biomedical scientists) categories (Numbers only). See List of AHP/HSS Disciplines at the end of this email.
- 3. Current supplier(s) for international recruitment projects/general permanent recruitment (Broken down into staff categories ie Doctors, Nurses, AHP/HSS)
- 4. Any exclusive agreements or managed services used (Please include start and end dates of contracts)
- 5. Frameworks currently called off for International placements/general permanent recruitment (e.g. London Procurement Partnership, CCS RM6162)
- 6. The average fee for a Doctor, nurse, AHS/HSS that is placed with respective rebate periods. (Please provide break down for separate charges such as relocation and other elements)
- A1 1. Information not held we do not have an international recruitment budget, costs included in a wider HR
 - Medical Nursing Nursing AHP 13.49 FTE vacancies
 HSS 5.12 FTE vacancies
 - 3. Information not held Currently no supplier for international recruitment
 - 4. Information not held not applicable based on response to Q3
 - 5. Information not held not applicable based on response to Q3
 - 6. Information not held not applicable based on response to Q3