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 This is a follow up request from FOI202324/040 
  
Q1 Please can you supply the data sharing agreement between Deontics, Soar Beyond, 

Interface Clinical Solutions, and yourselves/Novartis. 
  
A1 Information not held - Innovation Agency has no involvement with project management 

of the Interface Clinical Solutions Workforce Support initiative. Contracting and project 
implementation are managed directly between Interface Clinical Solutions and individual 
PCNs/Practices. 

  
Q2 Please can you supply a copy of the Automated Lipid MDT which produced the Tech 

enabled lipid management clinics protocol, ie we wish to understand the clinical decision 
making which was provided by these organisations. 

  
A2 Information not held - Innovation Agency has no involvement with project management 

of the Interface Clinical Solutions Workforce Support initiative. Contracting and project 
implementation are managed directly between Interface Clinical Solutions and individual 
PCNs/Practices. 

  
Q3 The documentation says that case studies may be organised via FCB health etc. Were 

any companies used to provide case studies/marketing material as a result? 
  
A3 Information not held - Innovation Agency has no involvement with project management 

of the Interface Clinical Solutions Workforce Support initiative. Contracting and project 
implementation are managed directly between Interface Clinical Solutions and individual 
PCNs/Practices. 

  
Q4 Can you please tell me the membership of  

a. Strategic Oversight Group (SOG)  
b. Joint Steering Committee (JSC)  
c. AHSN CVD Programme Board (TBC)  
d. Clinical Leadership Group (under review with the intention of forming a joint group 

with CPU) and if these included any Novartis employees. 
  
A4 Information not held - These are not Innovation Agency meetings – this information 

would need to be requested from AHSN Network / NHS England 

 


