

Reference FOI202324//064

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 11 May 2023

Subject: Contact details for execs and service leads

- Q1 Please could you provide the name and email for the following job roles withing your organisation, as of March 2023:
 - a. Chief Operating Officer
 - b. Deputy Chief Operating Officer
 - c. Director of Performance
 - d. Director of Operations
 - e. Associate/deputy Director of Operations
 - f. Patient Access Manager
- A1 a. Jonathan Mathews, Jonathan.Mathews@lhch.nhs.uk
 - b. No specific role, this falls under the remit of our Divisional Heads of Operations for Surgery, Clinical Services and Medicine
 - c. No such role, this falls under the remit of our Chief Operating Officer
 - d. As per A1c.
 - e. As per A1b
 - f. Collette Furlong Collette.Furlong@Ihch.nhs.uk
- Q2 Please could you provide the names and email addresses for the following, within the following specialities:
 - a. General Surgery

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

b. Urology

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

c. Trauma & Orthopaedics

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

d. ENT

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

e. Ophthalmology

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

f. Dermatology

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

g. Cardiology

Clinical Director:

Service Manager:

A2

a. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide General Medicine.



- b. Information not held We do not have a Urology department.
- c. Information not held We do not have a Trauma & Orthopaedics department.
- d. Information not held We do not have an ENT department.
- e. Information not held We do not have an Ophthalmology department.
- f. Information not held We do not have a Dermatology department
- g. Medical Director Dr John Morris, <u>John.Morris@Ihch.nhs.uk</u> Service Manager – Ellis Hayes, <u>Ellis.Hayes@Ihch.nhs.uk</u>
- Q3 Has the Trust utilised the services of an Insourcing Company (utilising Insourced clinical staff within Trust facilities to undertake additional activity) within the Financial Year 2021/2022 and 2022/23 if you have them?
- A3 Information not held no insourcing companies used for 2021/2022 and 2022/2023
- Which specialties has the Trust utilised Insourcing for within the Financial Year 2021/2022 and 2022/23 (if you have them) and the spend in each of those specialties?
- A4 Information not held as per A3
- Which specialties has the Trust utilised Outsourcing for within the Financial Year 2021/2022 and 2022/23 and the spend in each of those specialties?

A5	Speciality	Spend for 2021/2022	2022/2023
	Radiology	£701,038.70	£577,577.00