
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI2021/061 

From: 
 

Other 

Date: 
 

22 February 2021 

Subject: 
 

Number of DNACPR orders in 2019-2020 

 
Q1 How many DNACPR orders were issued between 23rd March 2019 – 1st August 2019 

(period 1)? 
  
A1 61 
  
Q2 How many DNACPR orders were issued between 1st October 2019 – 31st January 2020 

(period 2)? 
  
A2 65 
  
Q3 How many DNACPR orders were issued between 23rd March 2020 – 1st August 2020 

(period 3)? 
  
A3 62 
  
Q4 How many DNACPR orders were issued between 1st October 2020 – 31st January 2021 

(period 4)?  
  
A4 66 
  
Q5 Please provide aggregate data for each period as follows: 

a. Patient sex/gender (whichever term you use) 
b. Patient age category (16 or under; 17-24; 25-29; 30-34; 35-39; 40-44; 45-49; 50-54; 

55-59; 60-64; 65-69; 70-74; 75-79; 80-84; 85-89; 90 or above) 
c. Patient ethnicity (as per government categories https://www.ethnicity-facts-

figures.service.gov.uk/style-guide/ethnic-groups and see attached table) 
d. Underlying health conditions (cancer; chronic kidney disease; chronic obstructive 

pulmonary disease; heart conditions; obesity; other; none) 
e. Diagnosed learning disability (number of patients with a diagnosed learning disability) 
f. Number of DNACPR orders issued with and without patient consultation/knowledge 
g. Number of patients who died within 8 weeks of DNACPR order 

  
A5 a. Patient sex/gender (whichever term you use) 

Count of MPI Column Labels 
   

Row Labels Period 1 Period 2 
Period 
3 Period 4 

Grand 
Total 

Female 29 28 22 22 101 
Male 32 37 40 44 153 
Grand Total 61 65 62 66 254 

 
 

b. Patient age category (16 or under; 17-24; 25-29; 30-34; 35-39; 40-44; 45-49; 50-54; 

https://www.ethnicity-facts-figures.service.gov.uk/style-guide/ethnic-groups
https://www.ethnicity-facts-figures.service.gov.uk/style-guide/ethnic-groups


 
55-59; 60-64; 65-69; 70-74; 75-79; 80-84; 85-89; 90 or above) 

Count of MPI Column Labels 
   Row Labels Period 1 Period 2 Period 3 Period 4 Grand Total 

30-34 
   

1 1 
35-39 

  
1 

 
1 

40-44 1 
   

1 
45-49 2 2 1 3 8 
50-54 2 1 2 

 
5 

55-59 1 4 4 3 12 
60-64 7 1 2 1 11 
65-69 6 12 12 11 41 
70-74 12 10 14 13 49 
75-79 10 12 9 12 43 
80-84 14 9 4 11 38 
85-89 5 8 7 7 27 
90 or above 1 6 6 4 17 
Grand Total 61 65 62 66 254 

 
 

c. Patient ethnicity 
Count of MPI Column Labels 

   
Row Labels Period 1 Period 2 

Period 
3 Period 4 

Grand 
Total 

WHITE - BRITISH 57 60 56 60 233 
NULL 3 3 2 3 11 
OTHER - CHINESE 

  
2 

 
2 

ASIAN - INDIAN 
   

2 2 
NOT STATED 1 

  
1 2 

ASIAN - 
PAKISTANI 

  
1 

 
1 

WHITE - IRISH 
  

1 
 

1 
ASIAN - ANY OTHER 
BACKGROUND 1 

  
1 

OTHER - ANY 
OTHER 

 
1 

  
1 

Grand Total 61 65 62 66 254 
 
 

d. Underlying health conditions 
Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as 
part of its management or performance data.  
 
 

e. Diagnosed learning disability 
Information not held - Zero 
 

f.  
Count of MPI Column Labels 

   
Row Labels 

Capacity but no 
question 

Family 
questioned None 

Patient 
questioned 

Grand 
Total 



 
Period 1 3 26 6 26 61 
Period 2 1 26 2 36 65 
Period 3 

 
22 9 31 62 

Period 4 3 30 8 25 66 
Grand Total 7 104 25 118 254 

 
Number of DNACPR orders issued with and without patient consultation/knowledge. Please 
note: this has been based on whether the patient has been asked and whether the family 
were asked if the patient lacks capacity. This shows a total of 229/254 were either asked 
themselves or family were asked if they lacked capacity. These figures are extracted from 
one source only, however these discussions can be logged in several places within the 
patient record which would not be picked up in the data analysis. Quarterly audits into these 
figures show 100% of patients or patient families had been notified of these orders and 
discussions logged within their records. 
 

g. Number of patients who died within 8 weeks of DNACPR order 
Row Labels Count of MPI 
Period 1 43 
Period 2 36 
Period 3 43 
Period 4 45 
Grand Total 167 

 

 


