Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202223/049
Number:

From: Private Individual
Date: 10 May 2022
Subject: Contracts Register

Q1 The FULL contract register should display all the organisations existing/live contracts |
would like the register to display the following columns/headings:
a. Contract Reference -Unique reference number associated with the contract.
b. Contract Title
c. Procurement Category —Please state the category name of the contract, | wish to
know the category the contract is under.
Supplier Name
Spend (Total, Annual or contract value)
Contract’s Duration
Contract’s Extensions
Contract’s Start Date
Contract’s Expiry Date
Contract Description [Please provide me with as much detail as possible.]
Contact Owner (Person that manages the contract register)
CPV codes/Pro-Class

—rxTTSe@moo

Al a. See attached — FOI1202223-049 Contracts Register
b. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
c. Information not held — the Trust does not routinely hold this information
d. See attached — FOI1202223-049 Contracts Register
e. See attached — FOI1202223-049 Contracts Register
f. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
g. See attached — FOI1202223-049 Contracts Register
h. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
I. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
J. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
k. See attached — FOI202223-049 Contracts Register
l.  Information not held — the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information
centrally as part of its management or performance data.
Q2 Can you also provide me with contact details of the person responsible for the actual

contract’s register or someone responsible for AP1? [Name, Job Title, Telephone, Email
Address] At the very least provide me with their actual job title.

(Meaning of API “a set of functions and procedures that allow the creation of
applications which access the features or data of an operating system, application, or
other service.”)

A2 Steven Doran — Head of Procurement Steven.Doran@Ilhch.nhs.uk



mailto:Steven.Doran@lhch.nhs.uk

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust - Contracts Register

Contract Name Contract Ref |Supplier (s) Description (Services or Products) Start End Extension |Contract Date of last |Lead Lead
Contracts to be logged in Date Date Options  |Value contract Manager - |Manager -
alphabetical order Exclude  |(Months) [IncludeVATand reyjew? Job Title Contact
extension extenstion option
Number
. . X . . Clinical Coding
3M Medicode PO 124198056 3M United Kingdom plc [Data Coding License 12-Dec-21 |11-Dec-22 |12 months 6,755.00 Dec-20 Manager Ext. 1441
Hesis Ltd
Access Control Security Passes |PO 124190995  [(EQUIPMENT/SUPPOR |Door access control service and maintenance 01-Apr-21  [31-Mar-22 |0 months 3,044.63 Mar-20 Security Manager |Ext. 1051
T)/TDSI
Alder?ce (Reference site 1-year PO 124194369  |Aidence BV Veye Chest v2 - Lung Nodule Analysis and Reporting Al 26-Jul-21 25-Jul-22 |0 months 53,600.00 na PACS/RIS Ext. 1705
duration) Software Manager
Attend Anywhere Video Divisional Head of
Conferenc)?n NHSE Framework |Attend Anywhere Video conferencing 01-Apr-22 |31-Mar-24 [0 months 61,118.00 n/a Operations for Ext. 1033
9 Surgery
One year option Manager
Blue Cherry Spirostik PO 124196886 Love Medical Clinical Software Support 24-Sep-21 |23-Sep-22 to rer‘{ew P £12,225 + VAT Sep-22 Pulmonary Ext. 1782
Function
Catering Services T/0162 Medirest Catering services 01-Oct-18  [30-Sep-23 |24 months 6,720,000.00 Facilities Manager |Ext. 1695
Head of
Cath Lab Scheduling Software |n/a CareCube Clinical Software 11-Dec-17 [10-Dec-22 [0 months 0.00 Operations, Ext. 1614
Medicine
Resourcing and
Childcare Vouchers n/a EdenRed Childcare vouchers 01-Aug-19 |31-Jul-22 12 months 100,000.00 Workforce Ext. 1661
Systems Manager
Clinical Utilisation Review Vital Hub (previousl Deputy Director of
(MCAP System, Implementation, [NHSE Framework P Y |clinical Software 23-Sep-19 |22-Sep-23 |12 months 32,400.00 puty O lExt. 1653
Oak Group) Nursing & Qualtiy
and Support)
HTE project ref:
Clinical Waste Services ;;—281 /RSeggg_ SRCL Limited Clinical waste services 23-Apr-22  |22-Apr-25 |24 months 840,000.00 Apr-22 Facilities Manager |Ext. 1695
022883 Lot1
CIVICA DECLARE na Civica UK Ltd Govgrnance software implementation, hosting and support 01-Apr-22 rolling na 7.440.00 Mar-22 Director of ) Ext. 1668
services contract Corporate Affairs
NHS SBS
Framework
Agreement for the
Community Elewom? Patient Provision of EMIS Electronic patient record system and maintenance 21-Dec-17 |21-Dec-22 |24 months 574,692.00 PT"!‘*C‘ Manager, Ext. 3029
Record Support Services Healthcare Digital Systems
Clinical
Information
Services
Confidential
Conf.ldentlal Waste Destruction - |Waste . Shred-It Confidential Waste Destruction Services 10-Aug-19  |09-Aug-22 Facilities Manager [Ext. 1695
Services Destruction
Services
COSHH Risk and Safet
COSHH Management Management Alcumus Sypol Limited |Provision of risk management services 01-Jul-19  |30-Jun-23 [0 months 24,000.00 Lead Y |Ext. 1051
Services
Decontamination Services Aintree Steris Decontamination Services 01-Jun-19  [30-Nov-22 (12 months 550,000.00 Decqntamlnatlon Ext. 1698
Framework Service Lead
SS:ZS?ZZQIOSCIEQNCC/ Divisional Head of
Digital Dictation Tender ref: Bluewire Technologies |[Software and Support Services 01-Apr-22  [31-Mar-27 |0 months 444,000.00 Oct-26 Operations for Ext. 1033
DL581206 Surgery
EAP Services n/a Mersey Care Staff Support (Wellbeing) Services 01-Nov-16 |31-Aug-22 |ROMN9 12 o7 4azinc VAT |Aug-20 Head of HR Ext. 3213

months
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NHS SBS
Framework
Agreement for the
gf:é’;’:';;jf'g: Record E:’;’l'tf]'é’;rgf G"Ksﬁ'n‘:itfe:ea"hcare ' | tectronic patient record 22-Jun-17 |21-Jun-22 (36 months  [1,917,665.00 'f?rsgggfﬁzgzﬁ.‘;' Ext. 4740
Clinical
Information
Services
LD21392 - 24 months
Framework for
L (Trust must
EMIS Tquest contract details to provision of . . . give 6-months -
X healtcare clinical |EMIS Health Electronic patient records order comms services 17-Jul-19 16-Jul-22 N 145,440.00 Facilities Manager |Ext. 3029
be added here when signed . Ny notice of
information . :
. intention to
system services extend
NHS SBS
Medical
Equip PO124189160 Integra (e-Quip) Limited |Medical Equipment Database 01-Apr-21  |31-Mar-24 [0 months 18,362.00 Feb-21 Engineering Ext. 1569
Manager
Rostering Software and Services:-
HealthRoster SaaS Licence
BankStaff SaaS Licence
Rota SaaS Licence
. HSSF Allocate Software eJobPlan (Medics) SaaS Licence
e-Rostering LHC00124092021 | Limited eJobPlan (Non-Medics) Saas Licence 01-Oct-21 |30-Sep-23 |12 months 472,940.40 Sep-21 Head of HR Ext. 3213
MedicAppraisal SaasS Licence
MedicOnDuty SaaS Licence
SMS Subscription (Tariff 1)
SMS Text Bundle
- Resourcing and
e-Rostering Support Services T/0166 SCC/Allocate/Sprint i Support for Rostering Software and Services 09-Sep-15 |n/a 12 months 18,000.00 Workforce Ext. 1848
Framework rolling
Systems Manager
E-Tendering System n/a Proactis E-tendering software and support services 01-Sep-18 |31-Aug-22 |None 25,344.00 Sep-19 E?oe:jj?efment Ext. 1638
Resourcing and
Expenses Health Services LHCO001 Selenity Limited Expenses Health Services 01-Oct-20 |30-Sep-21 |12 months 4,644.00 Workforce Ext. 1848
Systems Manager
Resourcing and
Expenses Health Services LHCO001 Selenity Limited Job evaluator 08-Nov-20 |07-Nov-21 |12 months 1,888.74 Workforce Ext. 1848
Systems Manager
" ) . . Chief Finance
External Audit Services T/0192 Grant Thornton External Audit Services 01-Oct-20 |30-Sep-22 |0 months 339,600.00 Sep-20 Officer Ext. 3121
Finance/Procurement System fg}gg 080- SBS Shared Services  |Finance/Procurement System software and support services [01-Apr-12  [31-Mar-26 | 0 months 1,250,000.00 Mar-20 g?flitz;rlnance Ext. 3121
G2 Speech Digital Dictation; -
Suppzn and N?aintenance . DIVISIOhaI Head of
L PO 124191045 G2 Speech Software and Support Services 30-Jun-20 |31-Mar-22 |0 months 75,000.00 Operations for Ext. 1033
Services; Outsourced
. Surgery
Transcription
2018/S 003-
gz:zﬁ:g:;gsn Equipment and g(g?i%_(NHS- Eﬁ;esn::;spw%t;il] Care/ Haemofiltration Equipment Service Support and Consumables|01-Dec-19 [30-Nov-24 [0 months 770,000.00 f\)ﬂgtrl](;e;e(sare Ext. 1062
AK00072)
LHC_HC_200821
G-cloud Healthcare Associate
Healthcare Comms framework Communications UK SMS reminder/digital letter solutions 01-Sep-21 [01-Aug-25 (12 months x 1 [905,136.20 n/a Director, Digital 07863 135350
reference Limited Transformation

RM1557
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Healthy Imaging MIT2020-1047 Philips Healthcare Phase 1 pilot - Cardiology Archiving system (ISCV) 01-Apr-20  [31-Mar-23 |0 months 216,054.28 mg:g::s Ext. 1705
:gisc)“”'ca' Information System |.r;, ;7 Silverlink Software Patient Administration System and Support Services 01-Oct-15 [31-Mar-23 [12months  |2,252,741.00 Jan-21 Deputy CDIO  |Ext.
. . Computer Disposals . . Activity based (rate .
ICT equipment for disposal n/a . Secure ICT disposal services 08-Sep-20 |07-Sep-23 |24-months . new Assistant CDIO Ext. 3352
Limited (CDL) per equipment type)
Image Exchange Portal - Bum  |PO 124202563 Sectra Software and Support Services 01-May-22 12 month 12 months Activity based Nov-20 PACS/RIS Ext. 1705
Bank rolling Manager
Informatics Merseyside IM&T Support Services
Informatics Merseyside (IM) n/a (M) 01-Apr-20  |31-Mar-22 |24 months £788,173 p.a Deputy CDIO Ext. 3352
Instant Pay LHC001151220 |Allocate / Wagestream [Wage / salary streaming app 01-Jan-21 |31-Dec-22 [0 months 0.00 n/a Head of HR Ext. 3213
Intellispace PO124187227 Philips Healthcare Cardiology Archiving System 01-Apr-20  [31-Mar-23 (84 months 157,687.20 npngﬁ:él::s Ext. 1705
Interpreter and Translation . - . . - Patient and Family
: n/a Language Line Limited [Interpreter and Translation Services 05-Mar-19 [05-Mar-22 |12 months Activity based Mar-20 Ext. 1169
Services Support Manager
Inventory Management System |n/a Omnicell UK Ltd Inventory Management System and Software Support 01-Apr-10 |!ling 0 months 35,000.00 Mar-20 Head of Ext. 1638
Services contract Procurement
Linen and Laundry Services COCH framework |Elis UK Limited Linen and Laundry Services 01-Apr-22 |30-Mar-25 |24 months 1,195,000.00 Mar-22 Facilities Manager [Ext. 1695
Schappit Ltd (trading as Director of
LHCH app n/a N pp 9 Mobile app and web app Content Management System (CMS)|01-May-20 |30-Apr-23 [0 months 6,000.00 Strategic Ext. 1899
Piota Apps ) .
Partnerships
Lift service and maintenance n/a Allied Lift Services Ltd |Lift service and maintenance 01-Apr-19 g:;gct 0 months £49,048,46 Estates Manager |[Ext. 1203
Lloyds Pharmacy Homecare n/a Ll(.Jy.dS Pharmacy Dispense and delivery of medicines 27-Nov-19 rolling 0 months Activity based Deputy C.hlef Ext. 1470
Clinical Homecare Ltd contract Pharmacist
Lead
Nurse/Business
Lone Worker Devices n/a Reliance Protect Provision of lone worker device monitoring equipment 01-May-20 |30-Apr-25 |0 months 29,904.00 “KA:gv?lglzry Ext. 1299
Community
Services
Mobile Voice and Data Services [NS6/26012102  [Telefonica UK Mobile Voice and Data Services 31-Jan-21  [31-Jan-23 |0 months Activity based Jan-21 gsrsggﬁ::ﬁz:zﬁ?r Ext. 4740
. ) . - . Deputy Chief
Modular Building Hire T/0183 Portakabin Modular Building Hire 01-Feb-20 |31-Jan-25 |0 months 559,634.40 . X Ext. 1864
Finance Officer
ICD Device Senior Chief
Monitoring Services Monitoring Boston Scientific Clinical Monitoring Services 01-Apr-20 [n/a 12 month rolling Cardiac Clinical  |Ext. 1714
(Latitude) Physiologist
ICD Device rollin Senior Chief
Monitoring Services Monitoring (Care [Medtronic Clinical Monitoring Services 01-Apr-20 9 12 month rolling Cardiac Clinical  |Ext. 1714
. contract . .
Link) Physiologist
Multi-Function Devices T/0200 Konica Minolta Print services 30-Jun-18 |29-Jun-23 [0 months 179,745.20 Associate .DII'eCtOI' Ext. 4740
for Operational IT
Natural Gas RM897 Total Supply of Natural Gas 01-Apr-22 _ [31-Mar-23 |0 months Activity based Head of Estates  |Ext. 1203
Network Infrastructure PO124197955 |Intercity Technology  |Network Infrastructure Support Services 01-Jan-22 |31-Mar-23 |0 months 49,444.80 Jan-22 Associate Director | o 474,
Support/Maintenance for Operational IT
NHS Membership Database 1pg 124201606 |Civica UK Limited Database Services 01-Apr-22 [31-Mar23 [Omonths  [8,160.00 Mar-20 Director of e 1688
System Corporate Affairs
Divisional Head of
Nuvoair n/a Nuvoair Telemedicine - Spriometer and associated mobile app 20-Jul-20 31-Dec-22 |0 months 130,000.00 n/a Operations, Ext. 3193
Medicine
Occupational Health Services n/a Team Prevent Occupational Health service 01-Apr-22_|31-Mar-24 |0 months Mar-22 Head of HR Ext. 3213
Off site Data Centre - Clinical . . . . . .
and Digital Information Systems |LPP Aimes Off site Data Centre - Clinical and Digital Information Systems |,y .0 18 |31.Mar-23 |12 months 300,000.00 Associate Director | 4744

Framework (CDIS)

Services

for Operational IT
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NHS SBS Head of
Off site Medical Records 15/CW/ZWD/B84 |Restore Offsite document storage and destruction 27-Feb-20 |26-Feb-24 |N/A Information not held 1\, 5, Information Ext. 1368
Storage 6/08 transactional costs Goverance &
Administration
) - - ] PACS/RIS
PACS 352564-2011-EN |Carestream Picture Archiving and Communication System Services 01-Jul-18 30-Jun-23 |0 months 562,812.00 Manager Ext. 1705
St. Helen's & Knowsle: Resourcing and
Payroll Services HTE N|;|S Trust Y Payroll Services 01-Oct-17  [30-Sep-22 (24 months 170,000.00 Apr-21 Workforce Ext. 1848
Systems Manager
Perfect Ward PO124186822  |Perfect Ward Software subscription 09-Oct-20 [08-Oct-23 |24 months ~ [137,430.00 Deputy Director of |y 1553
Nursing & Qualtiy
Pharmacy Secure Courier n/a ERS Courier services 02-Aug-19 |01-Aug-22 |24 months  [27,679.05 Aug-21 Deputy Chief 14 1470
Service Pharmacist
. Information Not Held .
Phar.macy Secure Courier n/a Merlin Courier services 02-Jul-19  [01-Jul-22 |24 months — Transactional Jul-19 Deputy thef Ext. 1470
Service Pharmacist
Costs
Pharmacy System Software and |47 EMIS Clinical software 01-Apr-15  [31-Mar-22 [12months  |170,000.00 Acting Chief Ext. 1824
Support Pharmacist
Qlikview n/a ClikHealth Solutions  |Finance Software Services 01-Jul-20  [30-Jun-22 |0 months 12,129.00 Jun-20 x‘fé’oﬂitam Ext 1072
Radiation Protection Services P0O124203251 IRS Limited Radiation Protection Services 01-Apr-17  [31-Mar-23 |0 months 69,056.00 I&ZZ?Ographer Ext. 1009
Radiology Information SerVices | 352564.0011-EN |1 o!PeiNG SOfWare oo ient Administration System and Support Services 01-Ju-18  |30-un-23 [Omonths  [421,200.00 PACSIRIS Ext. 1705
(CRIS) Group Ltd Manager
Radiology Maintenance Services PO 124182897 Mo.unt Intemahonal Service and maintenance of radiology equipment 01-Apr-20  [31-Mar-23 |12-months 175,000.00 Mar-20 PACS/RIS Ext. 1705
United Services Manager
. . Radiology Radiology Management | ... . X Ot Qan. . Activity based (rate ~ Lead
Radiology Services Services Solutions (RMS) Clinical Staffing 01-Oct-20 [30-Sep-22 [24-months per hour) Sep-20 Radiographer Ext. 1009
Resourcing and
Recruitment Services NHS Jobs Workforce Ext. 1848
Systems Manager
Rhapsody Integration Engine  |PO 124146546  |Lyniate 'm”:g{::;’:cing'”e software licencing, training and support & |4 g0 47 |34.aug-22 45,070.00 EPR Manager  |Ext 3101
glljs;pl(\:lre:nagement Software and Ref: 000009 Datix Ltd Risk management system and support services 01-Aug-15 |30-Nov-22 [0 months 108,000.00 Nov-21 s::;and Safety Ext. 1051
SBS framework - )
. . Link solutions IT2 Provision and implementation of Roboctic Process A§somate -
Roboctic Process Automation SBS/19/AB/WAB/ Trustco plc Automation (RPA) technology and services 01-Oct-21 31-Mar-25 |0 months 344,664.00 n/a Director, Dlgltal 07863 135350
Transformation
9411
Salad Money n/a Salad Money Staff loans 09-Nov-20 [n/a 12 month rolling Head of HR Ext. 3213
Somerset Cancer Register PO 124194819 |Somerset NHS FT System support 01-Apr-21__ [31/04/22 DDOH - Surgery |Ext 1605
;empm’y Workforce Solutions |4 sro52627 E:g;‘:';’:s;“pp“ers Provision of temporary workers (all categories) 26-Apr-21 |25-Apr23 |24 months  [activity based Head of HR Ext. 3213
HealthRoster &
Text Messaging Services n/a EE Limited Text Messaging Services 17-Dec-15 |n/a 12 month rolling(1,500.00 Temporary Ext. 1492
Staffing Manager
Travel Management Services CCS Framework |Redfern/CTM Travel Travel services 01-Apr-13  [31-Mar-23 |12 month rolling Ereoaciroefment Ext. 1638
rollin Cardiac
Zio PO 124203431 iRhythm ECG device 25-Jun-20 Contrgct Activity based Jun-20 Diagnostics Ext 1714
Manager
Vivup 319 19 SME HCI Ltd t/a Vivup _|Managed Services Platform and associated staff benefits 01-Apr-21__[31-Mar-24 |48 months 0.00 n/a Head of HR Ext. 3213
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