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Q1 Do you have any guidelines or formularies in place which govern the use of patient blood 

glucose monitoring meters at the point of care? 
 
If yes please provide the details of these guidelines. 

  
A1 Yes, the Trust follows guidelines issued by Liverpool Clinical Laboratories. 

 
Liverpool Clinical Laboratories is a division of Liverpool University Hospitals NHS 
Foundation Trust. For detail on these guidelines please re-direct your request to: 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

  
Q2 Do you have any guidelines or formularies in place which govern the use of patient blood 

ketone monitoring meters at the point of care? 
 
If yes please provide the details of these guidelines. 

  
A2 Information not held - We are currently introducing this within the Trust, however roll out is 

not yet completed and as such the relevant guidelines have not yet been finalised. 
  
Q3 From the options below, please indicate the closest proportion of consolidated blood 

glucose and ketone meters in use at your site as compared to separate meters: 
a. 10% consolidated meters vs 90% separate meters 
b. 25% consolidated meters vs 75% separate meters 
c. 50% consolidated meters vs 50% separate meters 
d. 75% consolidated meters vs 25 % separate meters 
e. 90% consolidated meters vs 10% separate meters 

  
A3 Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally 

as part of its management or performance data.  
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