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Number:  

FOI/2020/044 
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Private Individual 

Date: 
 

31 January 2020 

Subject: 
 

Contact details - CNIO; CIO; Clinical System Mgr; IT Business Analyst; 
Integration Mgr; Biomedical/Clinical engineer 

 
Q1 Under the freedom of information act please could I request the following information 

The name and email address of the person within your Trust that holds the following 
position or equivalent: 

a) Chief Nurse Information Officer 
b) Chief Information Officer 
c) Clinical Systems Manager 
d) IT Business Analyst 
e) Integration Lead/Manager 
f) Biomedical/Clinical engineer 

  
A1 a) This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2017 Disclosure 

Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 056: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then 
click Search. Select Download to open.  

b) This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2017 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 173: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/   
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then 
click Search. Select Download to open.  

c) Carol Moss, carol.moss@lhch.nhs.uk  
d) Information not held – not applicable, no such role 
e) Information not held – not applicable, provided by third party 
f) Karl Mundy, karl.mundy@lhch.nhs.uk  
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