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 Information regarding Electromagnetic Navigation (EMN), Virtual Navigation 

Bronchoscopy (VBN), and Planning Systems used for Bronchoscopy and Thoracic 
surgery 

  
Q1 Does the trust have the following brand of EMN, VBN, or Planning Systems on-site?  

a. SuperDimension™ navigation system (Medtronic)  
b. ILLUMISITE™ Platform (Medtronic),  
c. LungPoint Virtual Bronchoscopic Navigation System (Broncus Medical) 
d. The Archimedes System (Broncus Medical),  
e. We do not have any of these systems on-site. We use a different system (please 

can you provide details of the system) 
  
A1 a-d. Information not held – The Trust does not use any of these systems 

e. Information not held – The Trust does not currently detail if endoscopes have ENM 
fitted so we have provided a list of the Trusts flexible endoscopes, detailing model, 
manufacturer and purchase date. 

  
Q2 How many of the following ENM, VBN, or Planning Systems are at each site? 
  
A2 Information not held as per A1- Liverpool Heart and Chest Trust is a single site hospital 
  
Q3 Location of the ENM, VBN, or Planning Systems used on site? (i.e., endoscopy or 

theatres, etc.,) 
  
A3 Information not held as per A1 – We do currently have flexible endoscopes in theatres 

and endoscopy however 
  
Q4 Please provide the age of the ENM, VBN, or Planning Systems 
  
A4 Information not held as per A1 – however please see attachment Response 

FOI202324042 for details of the Trust’s flexible endoscopes 
  
Q5 Number of consumables (biopsy needles, forceps, and brushes) used per annum 

(Usage figures if possible) 
  
A5 Information not held - the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information 

centrally as part of its management or performance data. 
  
Q6 Are the consumables part of a consignment deal, if so when will it expire 
  
A6 No 
  



 
Q7 Are the consumables purchased direct or through the NHS supply chain? 
  
A7 Purchased through NHS supply chain 
  
Q8 Is there a minimum spend (for consumables) that each site is committed to? 
  
A8 No 
  

 



Brand Model Model Description Purchase Date
DP MEDICAL SYSTEMS 
LIMITED

DPM_ENDOFLEX XION ENDOFLEX UNIT 08/03/2019

DP MEDICAL SYSTEMS 
LIMITED

DPM_EV_NC_VIDEO_SC
OPE

XION 
NASOPHARYNGOSCOPE

12/03/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. EB-1170K PENTAX VIDEO 
BRONCHOSCOPE

01/01/2020

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. EB-1170K PENTAX VIDEO 
BRONCHOSCOPE

01/01/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. FI-10RBS PENTAX 
INTUBATION SCOPE

01/01/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. FI-10RBS PENTAX 
INTUBATION SCOPE

01/01/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB15_J10 OPTICAL BRONCHOSCOPE 29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB15_J10 OPTICAL BRONCHOSCOPE 22/03/2018

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB15_J10 OPTICAL BRONCHOSCOPE 22/03/2018

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

17/04/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

12/03/2021

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

01/01/2019

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

29/03/2023

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EB19-J10 PENTAX FLEXIBLE 
ENDOSCOPE

14/08/2018

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EC3870LK COLONOSCOPE 16/03/2021

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EC3870LK COLONOSCOPE 07/03/2007

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EG-1870K SLIM GASTROSCOPE 01/10/2006

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_EG-2970K 15/03/2004

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_F1-10RBS PENTAX ENDOSCOPY 
SYSTEM

23/02/2015

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_F1-10RBS PENTAX ENDOSCOPY 
SYSTEM

23/02/2015

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_F1-10RBS PENTAX ENDOSCOPY 
SYSTEM

23/02/2015

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_F1-10RBS PENTAX ENDOSCOPY 
SYSTEM

23/02/2015

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_F1-10RBS PENTAX ENDOSCOPY 
SYSTEM

15/08/2005

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_FB-18V 23/02/2015
PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_VIDEO_BRONCHOS

COPE
EB-1975K 06/01/2014

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_VIDEO_BRONCHOS
COPE

EB-1975K 06/01/2014

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_VIDEO_BRONCHOS
COPE

EB-1975K 06/01/2014

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. PNT_VIDEO_BRONCHOS
COPE

EB-1975K 06/01/2014

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. upper gi endoscope 
EG29i10

12/08/2020

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. upper gi endoscope 
EG29i10

01/01/2020

PENTAX U.K. Ltd. upper gi endoscope 
EG29i10

12/03/2021
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