Reference FOI202223/020

Number:

From: Commercial

**Date:** 13 April 2022

Subject: Number of Cancer trackers and cancer MDT co-ordinators are employed by

your Trust (WTE) and the split of cancer MDT co-ordniators WTE by each

tumour site of responsibility

- Q1 Over all how many Cancer Trackers are employed by your Trust (WTE)?
- A1 x1 Cancer Programme Support Manager (1.00 fte) x4 Cancer Tracker (3.20 fte)
- Q2 Over all how many cancer MDT co-ordinators are employed by your Trust (WTE)?
- A2 Zero.

However, we do have two MDT Coordinators (2.00 fte) although the job title does not reference cancer

- Q3 Please provide the split of cancer tracker WTE by each tumour site of responsibility
  - a. Lung
  - b. Breast
  - c. Head & Neck
  - d. Lower GI
  - e. Upper GI
  - f. Gynaelogical
  - g. Childrens
  - h. Acute leukaemia
  - i. Haematological malignancies (excluding acute leukaemia)
  - i. Testicular
  - k. Urological
- A3 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q4 Please provide the split of cancer MDT co-ordinators WTE by each tumour site of responsibility
  - a. Lung
  - b. Breast
  - c. Head & Neck
  - d. Lower GI
  - e. Upper GI
  - f. Gynaelogical
  - a. Childrens
  - h. Acute leukaemia
  - i. Haematological malignancies (excluding acute leukaemia)
  - j. Testicular
  - k. Urological



- A4 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q5 What cancer PAS system is used by your organisation? le Somerset, Infoflex other. If other please specify.
- A5 Somerset