
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI2021/006 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

06 January 2021 

Subject: 
 

Contact Details of Staff Leads 

 
 
Q1 I am submitting a request for information on the staff currently working in the following 

positions in your trust. Could you please supply full contact names and email addresses 
where possible please. 
 

a. Head of Estates 
b. Head of Facilities 
c. Head of Procurement 
d. Director of Infection Control 
e. Chief Nurse 
f. Deputy Chief Nurse 
g. Consultant Microbiologists 
h. Senior Fire Officers/Fire Safety Managers 
i. Emergency Services Senior Service Manager 
j. Radiology Senior Service Manager 
k. Paediatrics Senior Service Manager 

  
A1 a. Adam Hope – Adam.Hope@lhch.nhs.uk 

b. Sharon Hindley – Sharon.Hindley@lhch.nhs.uk 
c. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 151: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  
 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then 
click Search. Select Download to open. 

d. Information not held – No such role within the Trust. This would fall under the remit 
of the Medical Director 

e. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2019 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 263: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  
 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then 
click Search. Select Download to open. 

f. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
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This information is available on our website, it can be found in our GPs and 
Professionals section under Our Nursing Team 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/gps-professionals/our-nursing-team/senior-nursing-team/ 

g. Information not held – No such roles within the Trust. 
h. Information not held – No such roles within the Trust. Fire safety falls within the 

remit of the Estates Department. 
i. Information not held – No such role within the Trust. Liverpool Heart and Chest 

Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not have an 
Emergency Services Department. 

j. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found on our Radiology page: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/our-services/clinical-services/radiology-x-ray/ 

k. Information not held – No such role within the Trust. Liverpool Heart and Chest 
Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Paediatric 
services. 
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