

Reference FOI/2019/028

Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 17 January 2019

Subject: Trainees and HEE guidance

The request is in reference to trainees and compliance with HEE guidance.

- Q1 How many times were trainees moved from one department to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2017 and March 2018 (inclusive)?
- A1 Information not held we do not routinely hold this information
- Q2 How many times were trainees moved from one department to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2018 and the date of this email (inclusive)?
 - Of these, how many of the departments to which trainees were moved had declared Operational Pressures Escalation Level 4 (OPEL 4)?
- A2 Information not held we do not routinely hold this information
- How many trainees were moved from one department to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2017 and March 2018 (inclusive)?
- A3 Information not held we do not routinely hold this information
- How many trainees were moved from one department to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2018 and the date of this email (inclusive)?

Of these:

- 1. How many had worked in the department to which they were moved before?
- 2. How many received proper inductions as per the HEE guidance "Supporting winter pressures safely through managed education and training programmes"?
- A4 Zero we have never moved a trainee to any other hospital
- Q5 How many times were trainees moved from one hospital to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2017 and March 2018 (inclusive)?
- A5 Zero
- Q6 How many times were trainees moved from one hospital to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2018 and the date of this email (inclusive)?
 - i. Of these, how many of the departments/hospitals to which trainees were moved had declared Operational Pressures Escalation Level 4 (OPEL 4)?

- A6 Zero
- Q7 How many trainees were moved from one hospital to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2017 and March 2018 (inclusive)?
- A7 Zero
- Q8 How many trainees were moved from one hospital to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota between December 2018 and the date of this email (inclusive)?

Of these:

- 1. How many had worked in the hospital to which they were moved before?
- 2. How many received proper inductions as per the HEE guidance?
- A8 Zero
- Q9 Since the introduction of HEE guidelines in December 2018, how many times have you reported to the HEE and/or your local office, that you have moved a trainee from one department to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota?
- Q9 Information not held not applicable as above
- Q10 Since the introduction of HEE guidelines in December 2018, how many times have you reported to the HEE and/or your local office, that you have moved a trainee from one hospital to another outside of their planned work schedule/rota?
- A10 Information not held not applicable as above