

**Reference Number:** FOI/LHCH/2018/170  
**From:** Private Individual  
**Date:** 22 June 2018  
**Subject:** Theatres; CCU and endoscopy

Q1 The hospitals under your trust?

A1 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 'Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means'.

This information is available on our website: [www.lhch.nhs.uk](http://www.lhch.nhs.uk) – see About Us

Q2 Number and types of operating theatres

A2 9 theatres including 1, Hybrid Theatre and 1 pacing theatre

Q3 Number of beds within the critical/intensive care unit(s)

A3 30 beds within Critical Care  
19 in POCCU  
11 in Intensive Care  
We also have 4 High Dependency Beds

Q4 Number of endoscopy treatment rooms/theatres

A4 1 endoscopy treatment room

Q5 If possible I would like to know the make, model and age of the following equipment if applicable:

- 1.0 Ultra clean ventilation systems
- 2.0 General Theatres
- 3.0 Ceiling mounted medical service pendants
- 4.0 Operating lights
- 5.0 Theatre control panels
- 6.0 AHU Units
- 7.0 Class 1,2 & 3 Cabinets

A5

- 1.0 – Information not held - no UCV systems
- 2.0 – We do not understand what equipment you are referring to – please clarify
- 3.0 – Draeger – circa 2008
- 4.0 – Q Flow Merivaara – Installed 2018
- 5.0 – Draeger – 2008
- 6.0 – Air Handling Equipment – 2008
- 7.0 – Information not held – no cabinets