

**Reference Number:** FOI/LHCH/2018/127  
**From:** Private Individual  
**Date:** 11 May 2018  
**Subject:** Chargeable items - TC; Internet; Telephone

Q Does your trust charge patients for use of the following items?

- 1 a) Television  
 b) Internet  
 c) Telephone

Q If so what is the hourly charge as of 1 May 2018?

2

Q What is the total amount the Trust received in charges in each year 2017/18, 2016/17 and 2009/10 for each item?

3

- a) Television  
 b) Internet  
 c) Telephone

Q How many individual patients paid charges in each year 2017/18, 2016/17 and 2009/10 for each item?

4

- a) Television  
 b) Internet  
 c) Telephone

Q What was the highest amount charged to one patient for each item in each year 2017/18, 2016/17 and 2009/10.

5

- a) Television  
 b) Internet  
 c) Telephone

A		Television	Internet	Telephone
1	Charge for use? Y/N	No	No	No
-	Hourly charge as of 1 May 2018?		Information not held – not applicable	Information not held – not applicable
5	Total amount the Trust received in charges in year 2017/18	Information not held – not applicable	Information not held – not applicable	Information not held – not applicable
	Total amount the Trust received in charges in year 2016/17			
	Total amount the Trust received in charges in year 2009/10			
	Highest total amount charged to one patient for item in year 2017/18.			
	Highest total amount charged to one patient for item in year 2016/17.			
	Highest total amount charged to one patient for item in year 2009/10.			
	Total number of individual patients who paid charges in 2017/18			

Total number of individual patients who paid charges in 2016/17			
Total number of individual patients who paid charges in 2009/10			