

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2018/087
From: Other
Date: 10 April 2018
Subject: Last Year of Life Admissions

I am writing to request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act from your trust.

- Q1 During the financial year 2016/2017 or last full year figures, what:
- a) was the total number of emergency admissions for people in the last year of life?
 - b) was the total number of emergency bed days for people in the last year of life?
- A1
- a) Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
 - b) Information not held – as above
- Q2 During the financial year 2016/2017 or last full year figures, what was the total number of people in the last year of life admitted from a care home setting as an emergency?
- A2 Information not held – as above