

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2018/056
From: Press/Media
Date: 14 March 2018
Subject: Taxi and courier services

Q1 Please state the amount your authority spent on taxis and courier services in each of the following financial years:

This should include both taxis and private hire vehicles.

- i) 2012/13
- ii) 2013/14
- iii) 2014/15
- iv) 2015/16
- v) 2016/17
- vi) 2017/18 to 15.01.18

A1	i)	2012/2013 Taxis	£72,893	Couriers	£28,836
	ii)	2013/2014 Taxis	£70,679	Couriers	£30,260
	iii)	2014/2015 Taxis	£69,694	Couriers	£34,913
	iv)	2015/2016 Taxis	£98,207	Couriers	£41,881
	v)	2016/2017 Taxis	£78,070	Couriers	£38,342
	vi)	2017/2018 Taxis	£74,424	Couriers	£39,548

Q2 Please provide a breakdown of the amount spent on taxis and courier services by department (for example, pathology, accident and emergency, etc.)

Please provide information for each of the following financial years:

- i) 2012/13
- ii) 2013/14
- iii) 2014/15
- iv) 2015/16
- v) 2016/17
- vi) 2017/18 to 15.01.18

A2 Information not held at the level requested

Q3 Please provide a breakdown of the amount spent on taxis and courier services by reason for spend (for example, staff transport, transport of test results or samples etc.)

Please provide information for each of the following financial years:

- i) 2012/13
- ii) 2013/14
- iii) 2014/15
- iv) 2015/16
- v) 2016/17
- vi) 2017/18 to 15.01.18

A3 Information not held at the level requested.