

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2018/024
From: Commercial
Date: 02 February 2018
Subject: Contact details - leads for Workforce Development; Education; Diabetes; Respiratory; Practice Nurse Development & CVD Nurse

- Q1 Please can you provide names & email addresses for the following roles or equivalent for Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital?
- i. Workforce Development Lead/ Manager
 - ii. Education Manager/Lead
 - iii. Diabetes Lead
 - iv. Respiratory Lead
 - v. Practice Nurse Development Lead
 - vi. CVD Nurse Lead
- A1
- i. Information not held – we do not have this role. Our Director of Workforce Development is Joanne Twist
Joanne.Twist@lhch.nhs.uk
 - ii. Ruth Dawson, Head of Education & Development
Ruth.Dawson@lhch.nhs.uk
 - iii. Sarah-Jane Daley, Diabetes Specialist Nurse
SarahJane.Daley@lhch.nhs.uk
 - iv. Martin Ledson, Clinical Lead for Respiratory Medicine
martin.ledson@lhch.nhs.uk
 - v. Information not held – we do not have this role
 - vi. Elaine Gossage, Lead Nurse/Business Manager Knowsley Community Services
Elaine.Gossage@lhch.nhs.uk