

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2017142
From: Private Individual
Date: 01 June 2017
Subject: Hypothermia

Q1 Please could you supply a figure for the number of patients in Intensive Care in your Trust who were offered hypothermia therapy in each of the following financial years:
a) 2015/16
b) 2016/17

A1 a) 25
b) 20

Q2 Of these, please supply a figure for the number of patients who received a) surface cooling b) non surface (invasive) cooling or c) Targeted Temperature Management (hypothermia therapy) in each year.

A2 a) Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
b) Information not held – as above