

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2017093
From: Commercial
Date: 30 March 2017
Subject: Medical Locum spend 2016

Q1 I would like to request the Trusts Medical Agency Locum Spend for the year 2016.

Can you please break these figures down accordingly:

1. Agency Locum spend for A&E Doctors in 2016
2. Agency Locum spend for General and Acute medicine Doctors in 2016
3. Agency Locum spend for Radiology Doctors in 2016
4. Agency Locum spend for Paediatric Doctors in 2016
5. Agency Locum spend for Obs and Gynae Doctors in 2016
6. Total Medical Agency Locum Spend in 2016

- A1
1. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide A&E services
 2. See table below
 3. See table below
 4. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide paediatric services
 5. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide obstetrics and gynaecology services
 6. See table below

Please note:

- We have no consultant agency only Junior Doctor Medical Agency
- Information relates to financial year 2016/17 and is broken down as recorded by the Trust:

Subjective Code Description	Cost Centre	Total
Agency Med SHO & HO	Medicine Medical Staff	7,764.99
	Cardiac Surgery Medical Staff	2,395.80
Total		10,160.79