

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2017091
From: Private Individual
Date: 29 March 2017
Subject: MRI scans under general anaesthetic

Q1 How many patients each year have required an MRI under general anaesthetic in the following years:
a) 2016/17
b) 2015/16
c) 2014/15

A1 Information not held - the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data

Q2 What is the total approximate cost of these scans in each of the above years?

A2 Information not held - the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data