

**Reference Number:** FOI/LHCH/2017054  
**From:** Private Individual  
**Date:** 20 February 2017  
**Subject:** ICT documents

Q1 I would like to submit a freedom of information request for the following document relating to the following: ICT Documents

1. ICT Strategy- I require the document that hold future plan and strategy of the organisation's ICT department.
2. ICT Departmental Business Plan
3. ICT Technical Strategy.
4. ICT Structure
5. ICT Capital budgets and programmes

Can you please provide me with the latest document to date the organisation holds and please state this within the response. If no information is provided, I will contact the organisation back to verify that this is the latest version of the document.

If the organisation doesn't have a document that covers the current financial year, please provide me with information (month) on when this document will be published or updated. In the response please provide us with the previous document along with publish month of the future document.

If you feel that your organisation or the department hold other documents that relate to my request or the document above please send them accordingly.

A1 **1-3. Information not held. Work is in progress to develop a Digital Strategy 2017 – 2019 with an anticipated completion of May 2017**  
**4. Information not held - organisational structure in a transitional state**

**5. The below schemes are included in this year's Capital Plan:**

Network & Telephony upgrade	950,000
Blades (Server upgrade 15/16)	40,000
Blades (Server upgrade)	20,000
Mindray (Digital Observations)	14,000
Mobile Cart (upgrade scheme)	60,000
MCAP_CUR	9,190
Prodacapo	9,466
Digital Systems Team Relocation (Nursing Annexe)	10,880

Q2 Lead member: Cabinet Member for ICT and Telecommunications come under. Please can you provide me with their direct contact details including their Full Name, Actual Job Title, Contact Number and Direct Email Address?

Can you please provide me with a direct link to this committee?

A2 **Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 'Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means'.**

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2015 Disclosure Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 019:  
<http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/>

Enter 2015 into the Category field and 019 into the Title field then click Search. Select Download to open.