

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2017027
From: Private Individual
Date: 30 January 2017
Subject: Learning disability serious incidents and deaths

- Q1 a) total number of deaths that have occurred at the Trust in each of the last five years (please provide data broken down by year)
 b) the number of these deaths that were classified as unexpected

A1

	2012	2013	2014	2015	2016
a: In-hospital deaths	188	211	169	171	169
b: 'Unexpected' deaths	Information not held - we don't classify the deaths as 'expected' or 'unexpected' Please note there is no national definition of 'unexpected'				

- Q2 a) total number of deaths that have been referred to the Coroner by the Trust in each of the last five years
 b) of these, the number of deaths of patients with a learning disability referred to the Coroner

- A2 a) Information not held – the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
 b) Information not held – as per a) above

- Q3 a) total number of deaths of patients with a learning disability that have occurred at the Trust in each of the last five years (please provide total number and indicate whether they were inpatients at the time of their deaths)
 b) of these, the number of these deaths of patients with a learning disability that were classified as unexpected

A3

	2012	2013	2014	2015	2016
3a: Learning disability deaths	1	0	0	0	0
3b: 'Unexpected' learning disability deaths	Information not held - we don't classify the deaths as 'expected' or 'unexpected' Please note there is no national definition of 'unexpected'				

- Q4 a) total number of deaths at the Trust reported as an incident on the National Reporting and Learning System (NRLS) in each of the last five years
 b) total number of deaths at the Trust reported on Strategic Executive Information System (STEIS) in each of the last five years
 c) if possible, please indicate the number of these that relate to patients with a learning disability

- A4
- a) 2012 = 0
2013 = 1
2014 = 0
2015 = 0
2016 = 0
 - b) 2012 = 0
2013 = 0
2014 = 1
2015 = 0
2016 = 0
 - c) Neither relate to patient with learning disability.
- Q5
- a) total number of initial 72-hour reviews into deaths (as defined by the NHS Serious Incident Framework) in each of the last five years
 - b) total number of investigations into deaths (as defined by the NHS SI Framework) in each of the last five years - please provide data broken down by severity, Level 1 internal investigations, Level 2 comprehensive internal investigations, Level 3 independent investigations. Please also indicate whether the numbers refer to investigations opened or completed.
- A5
- a) 1 in 2014
 - b) 1 level 2 investigation completed in 2014