

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/2015169
From: Press/Media
Date: 13 July 2015
Subject: Maternity care

- Q1 How many labours were recorded for each of the previous three calendar years for each of these birth options:
a) home birth
b) birth in midwife-led unit
c) hospital birth (obstetrician-led unit)
- A1 [Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not provide maternity services.](#)
- Q2 Please list for each category how many labours resulted in caesarean delivery
- A2 [Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not provide maternity services.](#)
- Q3 Of the caesarean deliveries listed above, please state the number which were elective and out of those, which were booked on request of the patient.
- A3 [Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not provide maternity services.](#)
- Q4 If you hold information on the average cost for each birth option (home birth, midwife-led birth, hospital birth and additionally for caesarean), please can you provide this
- A4 [Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not provide maternity services.](#)