

Reference Number: FOI/LHCH/201516
From: Press/Media
Date: 21 January 2015
Subject: Doctors sickness

Q1 How many doctors working for the trust were signed off work due to sickness in the years:

- a) 2009
- b) 2010
- c) 2011
- d) 2012
- e) 2013
- f) 2014

A1

- a) 2009 = information not held*
- b) 2010 = information not held*
- c) 2011 = information not held*
- d) 2012 = information not held*
- e) 2013 = 12
- f) 2014 = 58

Q2 How many doctors working for the trust were signed off work due to mental health issues in the years:

- a) 2009
- b) 2010
- c) 2011
- d) 2012
- e) 2013
- f) 2014

A2

- a) 2009 = information not held*
- b) 2010 = information not held*
- c) 2011 = information not held*
- d) 2012 = information not held*
- e) 2013 = 0
- f) 2014 = 0

Q3 How many doctors working for the trust were signed off work due to a stress related illness in the years:

- a) 2009
- b) 2010
- c) 2011
- d) 2012
- e) 2013
- f) 2014

A3

- a) 2009 = information not held*
- b) 2010 = information not held*

- c) 2011 = information not held*
- d) 2012 = information not held*
- e) 2013 = 0
- f) 2014 = 1

Q4 How many doctors working for the trust were signed off work for a period longer than three months due to a stress related illness in the years:

- a) 2009
- b) 2010
- c) 2011
- d) 2012
- e) 2013
- f) 2014

- A4
- a) 2009 = information not held*
 - b) 2010 = information not held*
 - c) 2011 = information not held*
 - d) 2012 = information not held*
 - e) 2013 = 0
 - f) 2014 = 0

* Information not held – the Trust did not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data until 2013.

Please note that the figures provided do not include doctors in training. Doctors in training are employed by St Helens & Knowsley Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust. If you require this information please contact them directly at foirequests@sthk.nhs.uk